JUDICIAL COUNCIL OF CALIFORNIA, ADMINISTRATIVE OFFICE OF THE COURTS
MASTER AGREEMENT AMENDMENT COVERSHEET

AGREEMENT NUMBER

MA-301110 002

AMENDMENT NUMBER

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID NUMBER

52-0675776

1. This Amendment No. 2 to Master Agreement No. MA-301110 by and between Dunbar Armored, Inc.
(“Contractor”) and the Judicial Council of California, Administrative Office of the Courts (“AOC”") is made
and entered into this 1st day of June 2014 (“Effective Date”) in the State of California.

2, Al capitalized terms not defined in this Amendment have the meanings given to them in the Master Agreement

referenced above.

3. The parties agree to amend the Master Agreement as follows:

a. The purpose of this amendment is to i.) Extend the Agreement Term, ii.) Price Adjustment increase

b. The contractor shall continue to furnish to the 58 Superior Courts of California, the California Appellate
Courts, which includes the Supreme Court of California,and the Administrative Office of the Courts
(individually referred to as a member of the “Purchasing Group “Customer”), services and materials as
required in accordance with the terms and conditions of this Master Agreement.

¢. Exhibit C, Section 2, Term, the AOC exercises its option to extend the Master Agreement term for the First
Option Term period beginning July 01, 2014 to June 30, 2015 and to implement a price increase adjustment
of 1.4% per the Los Angeles Area Consumer Price Index as pubiished by the U.S, Bureau of Labor Statistics.

d. Exhibit B, Payment Provisions, are hereby deleted and replaced with Exhibit B, Revision No. 1, attached

hereto and incorporated herewith.

e. The expiration date of the Master Agreement is hereby changed from June 30, 2014 to June 30, 2015.

Except as provided in this Amendment, all terms and conditions of the original Master Agreement, as amended,

4. remain in full force and effect.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, this Amendment No. 2 has been entered into by the parties hereto, effective upon

the Effective Date.

AOC’S SIGNATURE

Judicial Council of California,
Administrative Office of the Courts

BY (Authorized Signature)

ol A 6/l

PRINTE ND TITLE ERSON SIGNING

Stephen Saddier, Manager, Business Services
ADDRESS

455 Golden Gate Avenue, 6™ Floor
San Francisco, CA 94102

CONTRACTOR’S SIGNATURE

CONTRACTOR'S NAME (if Contractor is not an individual person, state whether Contractor i
a corporation, partnership, etc.)

Dunbar Armored, Inc.
BY (Authorized Signature)
&
PRIN D NAME AND TITLEOF  RSON SIGNING

J. Patrick Frampton, VP

ADDRESS
Attn: Rosemary Ayala
50 Shilling Road

Hunt Valley, MD 21031



EXHIBIT B
PAYMENT PROVISIONS
REVISION NO. 1

1 Pricing /Revised]
The price schedule is set forth below.

Delivery
to the
Bank

Next Base Price
Loc Name Loc Address Loc City Same Day Day Per Month
David V. Kenyon
Juveniie Justice 7625 South Central

Center Avenue Los Angeles X $290.00
Central Civil West 600 South

Court Commonwealth Avenue  Los Angeles X $290.00
Metropolitan

Courthouse 1945 South Hill Street Los Angeles X $290.00

Clara Shortridge
Foltz Criminal

Justice Center 210 West Temple Street Los Angeles $290.00
Central

Arraignment

Courts 429 Bauchet Street Los Angeles $290.00
Stanley Mosk

Courthouse 111 North Hill Street Los Angeles $290.00
Hall of Records 320 West Temple Street Los Angeles $290.00
County Records

Center 222 North Hill Street Los Angeles $290.00
300 S. Spring

Street - 2 DCA 1-5,

7-8 and Sup 300 S. Spring Street Los Angeles $290.00
East Los Angeles 4848 E. Civic Center East Los

Courthouse Way Angeles $290.00
West Los Angeles

Courthouse 1633 Purdue Avenue Los Angeles $290.00
Small Claims Court

- 99A 1633 Purdue Ave. Los Angeles $290.00
Former Jury

Assembly Trailer 1633 Purdue Ave. Los Angeles $290.0(C
Jury Assembly

Trailer 1633 Purdue Ave. Los Angeles $290.0C
1772 LaBaig

Avenue 1772 LaBaig Avenue Los Angeles $290.0C
Hollywood 5925 Hollywood

Courthouse Boulevard Los An eles $290.0C
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Eastlake Juvenile
Court

Airport Courthouse

Mental Health
Court

Beverly Hills
Courthouse

Compton
Courthouse

Downey
Courthouse

Los Padrinos
Juvenile Court
Huntington Park
Courthouse

Malibu Courthouse

Redondo Beach
Courthouse
Ingiewood Juvenile
Court

inglewood
Courthouse

Santa Monica
Courthouse

S. Bay Muni Court
Jury Assembly
Trailer

Torrance
Courthouse

Torrance Annex
S. Bay Municipal
Traffic Court
Trailer

Whittier
Courthouse
Norwalk
Courthouse
Catalina
Courthouse

Beliflower
Courthouse

San Pedro
Courthouse Annex
San Pedro
Courthouse

Long Beach
Courthouse

1601 Eastlake Avenue

11701 South La
Cienega Boulevard

1150 North San
Fernando Road

9355 Burton Way

200 West Compton
Boulevard

7500 East imperial
Highway

7281 East Quill Drive

6548 Miles Avenue

23525 Civic Center Way

117 West Torrance
Boulevard

110 Regent Street
One Regent Street

1725 Main Street

825 Maple Dr.

825 Maple Avenue

3221 Torrance
Boulevard

825 Maple Dr.

7338 South Painter
Avenue

12720 Norwalk
Boulevard

215 Sumner Avenue

10025 East Flower
Street

638 South Beacon
Street

505 South Centre Street

415 West Ocean
Boulevard

Los Angeles
Los Angeles
Los Angeles
Beverly Hills
Compton

Downey

Downey
Huntington
Park

Malibu

Redondo
Beach

Inglewood
Inglewood

Santa Monica

Torrance

Torrance

Torrance

Torrance
Whittier
Norwalk
Avalon
Bellfiower
San Pedro
San Pedro

Lon Beach

Amendment No. 2 to Master Agreement No. MA 301110

Statewide Armored Car Services
With Dunbar Armored Inc.
Exhibit B —Payment Provisions

$290.00
$290.00

$290.00

$290.00
$290.00

$290.00
$290.00

$290.00
$290.00

$290.00
$290.00
$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00
$290.00

$290.00

$290.00
$290.00
$290.00
$290.00

$290.00
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Long Beach
Courthouse
Modular

Monrovia Training
Center

Monrovia
Warehouse

Pasadena
Courthouse
Glendale
Courthouse
Chatsworth
Courthouse
San Fernando
Courthouse
Syimar Juvenile
Court

Santa Clarita
Administrative
Center

Santa Clarita
Courthouse

Van Nuys
Courthouse West
Van Nuys
Courthouse East
Burbank
Courthouse

2255 N. Ontario -
JCC AOC South
Chino Courthouse
Rancho
Cucamonga
Courthouse
Rancho Juvenile
Traffic Court

Ei Monte
Courthouse
Edmund D.
Edeiman
Children's Court
Pomona
Courthouse North
Pomona
Courthouse South
433 East Foothill
Boulevard

West Covina
Courthouse

415 W. Ocean Bivd.
300 W. Maple Ave.

250 W. Duarte Road

300 East Walnut
Avenue

600 East Broadway
9425 Penfield Avenue
900 Third Street
16350 Filbert Street

23757 West Valencia
Bouievard

23747 West Valencia
Boulevard

14400 Erwin Street Mall
6230 Syimar Avenue

300 East Olive

2255 N. Ontario St.,
Suite 200
13260 Central Ave.

8303 Haven Ave.

0567 Arrow Ave, Ste. E,
Bidg. 1

11234 East Valiey
Boulevard

201 Centre Plaza Drive

350 West Mission
Boulevard

400 Civic Center Plaza
433 East Foothill
Boulevard, Building D

1427 West Covina
Parkwa

Long Beach
Monrovia
Monrovia
Pasadena
Glendale
Chatsworth
San Fernando

Sylmar

Santa Clarita
Santa Clarita
Van Nuys

Van Nuys

Burbank

Burbank
Chino

Rancho
Cucamonga
Rancho
Cucamonga

El Monte

Monterey Park

Pomona

Pomona
San Dimas

West Covina
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Statewide Armored Car Services
With Dunbar Armored Inc.
Exhibir B —Payment Provisions

$290.00
$290.00

$290.00

$290.00
$290.00
$290.00
$290.00

$290.00

$290.00
$290.00

$290.00
$290.00

$290.00

$290.00
$290.00

$290.00
$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00
$290.00

$290.00
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Alhambra
Courthouse

South County
Regional Center
East County
Regional Center
Ramona
Courthouse

Trailer Dept 34
North County
Regional Center -
Annex

North County
Regional Center
South

Trailer - Dept 35

Trailer - Family
Support

North County
Regional Center -
North

Family Court
County
Courthouse

Hall of Justice
Madge Bradley
Bidg.

750 B Street - 4
DCA 1
Department 10
Trailer
Department 11
Kearny Mesa
Traffic Court KM5
& KM6 Trailer
Department 9
Trailer

Kearny Mesa
Traffic Court KM3
Trailer

Kearny Mesa
Traffic Court KM4
Trailer

Juvenile Court

Kearny Mesa
Court

12396 World Trade

Drive

150 West
Commonwealth Avenue

500 Third Ave.
250 E. Main St.

1425 Montecito Rd.

325 South Melrose
Drive

325 South Melrose
Drive

325 South Melrose
Drive
325 South Melrose
Drive

325 South Melrose
Drive

325 South Melrose
Drive
1501-1555 Sixth Ave

220 West Broadway
330 West Broadway

1409 Fourth Ave

750 B Street, Suite 300

2851 Meadowilark Dr.
2901 Meadowlark Dr.

8950 Clairemont Mesa
Bivd.

2851 Meadowlark Dr.

8950 Clairemont Mesa
Blvd.

8950 Clairemont Mesa
Blvd.

2851 Meadowlark Dr.
8950 Clairemont Mesa
Blvd.

12396 World Trade
Drive, Suite 218

Alhambra

Chula Vista
El Cajon

Ramona

Vista

Vista

Vista
Vista

Vista
Vista
San Diego

San Diego
San Diego

San Diego

San Diego

San Diego
San Diego

San Diego

San Diego

San Diego

San Diego
San Diego

San Diego

San Die

Amendment No. 2 to Master Agreement No. MA 301110

Statewide Armored Car Services
With Dunbar Armored Inc.
Exhibit B —~Payment Provisions

$290.00

$290.00
$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00
$290.00

$290.00

$290.00
$290.00

$290.00
$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00
$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00
$290.00

$290.00

$290.00
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Larson Justice
Center

Annex Justice
Center (Indio)
indio County
Administrative
Center
Banning
Banning (FSB)
Sanger Court

Blythe Courthouse
- Superior Court
Calexico Court
Jail Court-E!
Centro

Juveniie Court
imperial County
Courthouse

El Centro Court at
Valley Plaza

Joshua Tree
Courthouse

Palm Springs Task
Force

Palm Springs
Courts
Winterhaven Court

Barstow Juvenile
Traffic

Barstow
Courthouse
Big Bear
Courthouse
Mental Health
Office and
Courtroom
Fontana
Courthouse

Fontana Jury
Assembly Room

Fontana Jury
Assembly Building
Hemet

Needles
Courthouse/Cierk's
Office

Needles
Courthouse-Dept.
N-1

46-200 Oasis Street

82-675 Highway 111

82-675 Highway 111
135 N. Alessandro
135 N. Alessandro
619 N St.

265 N. Broadway
415 Fourth St

328 Appilestill Rd.
324 Applestill Rd.

838 W. Main St.
1625 W. Main St

6527 White Feather Rd.

3700 Tachevah Dr,
#105, 106, 107 & 108

3255 E. Tahquitz
Canyon Way
2124 Winterhaven Dr.

301 East Mountain View
Street

235 East Mountain View
Street

477 Summit Blvd.

400 N. Pepper Ave.

17780 Arrow Hwy.
17830 Arrow Ave.

17782 Arrow Blvd.
880 N. State St.

1111 Bailey St., Civic
Center Complex

1111 Bailey St., Civic
Center Com lex

indio

indio

Indio
Banning
Banning
Sanger

Blythe
Calexico

El Centro
El Centro

El Centro
El Centro
Joshua Tree
Palm Springs

Palm Springs
Winterhaven

Barstow

Barstow

Big Bear Lake

Colton

Fontana
Fontana

Fontana
Hemet

Needies

Needies

Amendment No. 2 10 Master Agreement No. MA 301110

bl

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Statewide Armored Car Services

With Dunbar Armored Inc.

Exhibit B—Payment Provisions

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$171.37

$171.37

$118.64

$118.64

$290.00

$290.00
$290.00

$290.00
$290.00
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1776 Park Avenue
Redlands
Courthouse

Twin Peaks
Courthouse
Victorville
Courthouse-Dept.
N-1

766 S. Gifford

Distribution Center

Family Law Court -
DCSS

San Bernardino
Courthouse

San Bernardino
Juvenile Traffic
Juvenile
Dependency
Courthouse
Juvenile
Delinquency
Courthouse

E. Gilbert Campus-
Juvenile Court

E. Gilbert Campus-
Fiscal Services
Court Executive
Office

San Bernardino
Courthouse -
Annex

E. Gilbert Campus-
Court Technology

776 S. Gifford
780 S. Gifford

790 S. Gifford
Appellate &
Appeals North
Annex

3389 12th Street -
4DCA2

Simons Building
Famil Law Court

1776 Park Avenue,
Suite 136

216 Brookside Ave.

26010 State Highway
189

14455 Civic Dr.

766 S. Gifford Avenue,
Unit 2

770 S. Gifford Avenue

655 West 2nd Street,
Suite 200

351 N. Arrowhead Ave

175 West Fifth St.

860 E. Gilbert St.

900 East Gilbert St.
790 E. Gilbert St.,
Buiilding 9

790 E. Gilbert St.,
Building 7

172 W. Third St., 2nd
FL

351 N. Arrowhead Ave

790 E. Gilbert St.,
Building 11

776 S. Gifford Avenue
780 S. Gifford Avenue

790 S. Gifford Avenue

401 North Arrowhead

3389 12th Street
3610 11th St
4175 Main St.

Redlands

Redlands

Twin Peaks

Victorville

San
Bernardino
San
Bernardino

San
Bernardino
San
Bernardino

San
Bernardino

San
Bernardino

San
Bernardino

San
Bernardino

San
Bernardino

San
Bernardino

San
Bernardino

San
Bernardino
San
Bernardino
San
Bernardino
San
Bernardino

San
Bernardino

Riverside
Riverside
Riverside

Amendment No. 2 10 Master Agreement No. MA 301110

No Bid

b

Statewide Armored Car Services
With Dunbar Armored Inc.
Exhibit B —Payment Provisions

$290.00

$290.00

$171.37

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00
$290.00
$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00
$290.00
$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00
$290.00
$290.00
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Hall of Justice

Riverside Juvenile
Justice Trailers

Riverside Juvenile
Justice Trailers
Riverside Juvenile
Court

Hawthorne School
Civil

Moreno Valiey
Murrieta Juvenile
Dependency

Temecula
Harbor Justice
Center-Laguna
Hills Facility
Harbor Justice
Center-Newport
Beach Facility
West Justice
Center

Central Justice
Center, Civil
Complex Center
Central Justice
Center Annex
Central Justice
Center

601 W. Santa Ana
Bivd 4DCA3
North Justice
Center

Betty Lou
Lamoreaux Justice
Center

Computer Systems
Trailer

Corona

200 E. Santa Clara
-2DCAGB

Haill of Justice
East County
Courthouse

Santa Barbara
Jury Assembly
Bidg.

Fi ueroa Division

4100 Main St.

9991 County Farm
Road

9991 County Farm
Road

0091 County Farm Rd.

9174 Indiana Avenue
13800 Heacock Blvd

38860 Sky Canyon
Drive

41002 County Center
Dr.

23141 Moulton Parkway

4601 Jamboree Road

8141-8144 13th St.

751 W. Santa Ana Blvd.
909 North Main St.

700 Civic Center Dr W,
601 W. Santa Ana Bivd

1275 N. Berkeley Ave.

341 The City Dr.

331 The City Drive
South
505 S. Buena Vista

200 E. Santa Clara St.
800 S. Victoria Ave.

3855 Alamo Street

1108 Santa Barbara
118 E. Fi ueroa St.

Amendment No. 2 1o Master Agreement No. MA 301110

Riverside

Riverside
Riverside
Riverside X

Riverside
Moreno Valiey

Murrieta X
Temecula

Laguna Hills X
Newport Beach X

Wesiminster

Santa Ana X
Santa Ana
Santa Ana
Santa Ana

Fullerton

Orange

Orange
Corona

Ventura No Bid
Ventura X

Simi Valley

No Bid
No Bid

Santa Barbara
Santa Barbara

Statewide Armared Car Services
With Dunbar Armored Inc.
Exhibit B —Payvment Provisions

$290.00
$290.00
$290.00

$290.60

$290.00
$290.00

$290.60
$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00
$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00
$290.00

$319.060

$290.00

Page B-7



Santa Barbara
Court Trailer
Santa Barbara
Juvenile Court
Avenal Court
Coalinga Court
Corcoran Court
Delano/North Kern
Court

Hanford Building C
Probation Building
Hanford Buiiding B
Hanford Building A
East Kern Court-
Lake Isabelia
Branch

Arvin/ Lamont
Branch

Lemoore Superior
Court

New Porterville
Courthouse
Porterville
Courthouse

Shafter/Wasco
Courts Bldg.

Taft Courts Bldg.
Taft Superior Court
Modular

Tulare Division

Tulare Family Law
Facilitator

Visalia Convention
Center

Visalia Superior
Court

Adult Pre-Trial
Court

William Silveria Jr.
Juvenile Justice
Center

Tulare Family Law
Conservatorship
930 Truxtun
Avenue
Bakersfield Justice
Bidg.

Bakersfield
Superior Court
Bakersfield
Juvenile Center

118 E. Figueroa St.

4500 Hollister Ave.
501 E. Kings St.

166 W. Eim Street
1000 Chittenden Ave.

1122 Jefferson St.
1426 South Drive
1424 Forum Dr. Dept 8
1426 South Drive
1426 South Drive

7046 Lake Isabella
Bivd.

12022 Main St.

449 C St.

87 E. Morton Ave.

325 Central Valiey Hwy
311 N Lincoln St.

311 N Lincoln Street
425 E. Kern St.

3400 West Mineral King
Ave.

303 East Acequia

221 South Mooney
Bivd.

36650 Road 112

11200 Ave. 368

3400 West Mineral King
Ave.

930 Truxtun Avenue
1215 Truxtun Ave.
1415 Truxtun Avenue

2100 Colie e Ave.

Santa Barbara

Santa Barbara
Avenal
Coazlinga
Corcoran

Delano
Hanford
Hanford
Hanford
Hanford
Lake Isabella
Lamont
Lemoore

Porterville

Porterville

Shafter
Taft

Taft
Tulare

Visalia
Visalia
Visalia

Visalia

Visalia
Visalia
Bakersfield
Bakersfield
Bakersfield

Bakersfield

Amendment No. 2 to Master Agreement No. MA 301110

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
Ne Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Starewide Armored Car Services
With Dunbar Armored Inc.
Exhibit B—Payment Provisions
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Bakersfieid
Juvenile Center
3131 Arrow Street
Veterans Memorial
Bldg.

Juvenile Services
Center

1070 Paim St.
1120 Mill St.

Courthouse Annex
Grover Beach
Branch

Lompoc Division
Paso Robles
Courthouse

Miller Street Lease
Santa Maria
Juvenile Court
(new)

2601 Skyway Drive
Solvang Superior
Court
Mojave-County
Administration
Bidg.

Mojave Superior
Court Modutlar
Mojave-Main Court
Facility
Department 4
inyo Historic
Courthouse
Superior Court 2
Michael D.
Antonovich
Antelope Valley
Courthouse
Alfred J.
McCourtney
Juvenile Justice
Center

Mono Superior
Court

New Mammoth
Lakes Courthouse
Ridgecrest
Division B
Courtroom

2001 Coliege Ave.
3131 Arrow Street

801 Grand Ave.
1065 Kansas Ave.
1070 Palm St.
1120 Mill St.

1035 Paim St.

214 S 16th St.
115 Civic Center Plaza

901 Park Street
201 S. Miller Street

4285 California Blvd.

2601 Skyway Drive,
Suite A2

1745 Mission Drive

1775 Hwy. 58

1773 Highway 58

1773 Hwy. 58
301 West Line

168 N. Edwards St.
345 South Clay Street

42011 4th Street West

1040 West Avenue J

452 Old Mammoth Rd.

Main Street and Sierra
Park Road

420 N China Lake Blvd.

Bakersfield
Bakersfield
San Luis
Obispo
San Luis
Obispo
San Luis
Obispo
San Luis
Obispo
San Luis
Obispo

Grover Beach
LLompoc

Paso Robles

Santa Maria

Santa Maria

Santa Maria

Solvang

Mojave

Mojave

Mojave
Bishop

independence
Independence

Lancaster

Lancaster
Mammoth
Lakes
Mammoth
Lakes

Rid ecrest

Amendment No. 2 to Master Agreement No. MA 301110

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Statewide Armored Car Services
With Dunbar Armored Inc.
Exhibit B ~Payment Provisions
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Ridgecrest-Main
Facility

Sierra Courthouse
Clovis Court
Dinuba Division of
the Tulare Superior
Court

Firebaugh Court
Fowler Court
Kingsburg Court
Los Banos
Courtroom
Madera County
Superior Court
Madera Modutar 1
Missions Building
Madera Juvenile
Court

Reedley Court
Selma Court
2424 Ventura
Street - 5 DCA
North Annex Jail
Juvenile
Dependency
Family Support
Casablanca

1999 Tuoclumne
Fresno County
Courthouse

JJC Delinquency
Court

Salinas
Courthouse- North
Wing

168 West Alisal
Salinas Modular 3
Courtroom
Juvenile
Courthouse

King City
Courthouse
Marina Courthouse
Monterey
Courthouse

Hall of Justice

San Mateo IT
Traffic/ Small
Claims Annex

132 East Coso St.
40601 Road 274
1011 5th St.

640 South Alta Ave.
1325 O St

127 E. Merced
1600 California St.

445 | Street

209 W. Yosemite Ave.
209 W. Yosemite Ave.
760 | Street

28219 Avenue 14
815G St.
2424 McCall Avenue

2424 Ventura Street
1255 M St.

1245 -1255 Fulton Mall
2220 Tulare St.

2317 Tuolumne Street
1999 Tuolumne Street

1100 Van Ness Ave.

3333 E. American
Avenue

240 Church St.
168 West Alisal
240 Church Street
1422 Natividad Rd.

250 Franciscan Way
3180 Del Monte Bivd.

1200 Aguajito Rd.
400 County Center

399 Bradford Street,
Suite 105

500 Count Center

Ridgecrest
Bass Lake
Clovis

Dinuba
Firebaugh
Fowler
Kingsburg

L.os Banos

Madera
Madera
Madera

Madera
Reediey
Seima

Fresno
Fresno

Fresno
Fresno
Fresno
Fresno

Fresno

Fresno
Salinas
Salinas
Salinas
Salinas

King City
Marina

Monterey
Redwood City

Redwood City

Redwood Cit

Amendment No. 2 1o Master Agreement No. MA 301110

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

Statewide Armored Car Services
With Dunbar Armored Inc.
Exhibit B —Payment Provisions

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00
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Amendment No. 2 10 Master Agreement No. MA 301110
Statewide Armored Car Services

With Dunbar Armored Inc.

Exhibit B—Paymen: Provisions

Northern Branch South San

Courthouse 1050 Mission Rd. Francisco $290.00
Northern Branch South San

Jail Annex 1050 Mission Rd. Francisco $290.00
Sunnyvale

Courthouse 605 W. E! Camino Real  Sunnyvaie $290.00
Polk St. Annex 575 Polk St. San Francisco $290.00
Civic Center

Courthouse 400 McAllister St. San Francisco $290.00
455 Golden Gate -

JCC AOC Bay 455 Golden Gate

Area Avenue San Francisco $290.00
350 McAliister -

Sup Ctand 1 DCA 350 McAllister San Francisco $290.00
Hall of Justice 850 Bryant St. San Francisco $290.00
50 First Street -

HCRC Stg 1 50 First Street San Francisco $290.00
303 Second Street 303 Second Street, 4th

-HCRC Floor San Francisco $290.00
Family Justice

Center Site - Bidg

1 375 Woodside Avenue San Francisco $290.00
Family Justice

Center Site - Bidg

3 375 Woodside Avenue San Francisco $290.00
Family Justice

Center Site - Bidg

2 375 Woodside Avenue San Francisco $290.00
Youth Guidance

Center 375 Woodside Ave. San Francisco $290.00
Family Justice Woodside Ave. and

Center Portola San Francisco $290.00
Palo Alto

Courthouse 270 Grant St. Paio Alto $290.00
Central Branch 800 North Humbolt St. San Mateo $290.00
Juvenile Branch,

Paul Scannell

Drive 222 Paul Scannell Drive  San Mateo $290.00
George E.

McDonald Halt of

Justice 2233 Shoreline Drive Alameda $290.00
Concord-Mt.

Diablo District 2970 Willow Pass Rd. Concord $290.00
Law and Justice

Center 530 Union Ave. Fairfieid No Bid

Hall of Justice 600 Union Ave. Fairfield No Bid

Fremont Hall of 39439 Paseo Padre

Justice Pkwy. Fremont $290.00
Hayward Hall of

Justice 24405 Amador St. Hayward $290.00
Winton Blid 224 W. Winton Ave. Ha ard $290.00
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File Unit
Wakefield Taylor
Courthouse
Juvenile Hall
Finance Building
Family Law Center
Facilities &
Systems
Executive
Administration
Bray Courts

Archival Records -
Post Office

Jail Annex
Historic
Courthouse
Criminal Court
Building

Napa Juvenile
Court
Pittsburg-Delta
Pittsburg-Delta
Modular

John George
Psychiatric
Pavilion

Gale - Schenone
Hall of Justice
Solano Justice
Buiiding

2020 North
Broadway
Danville District
Courthouse
Wiley W. Manuel
Courthouse
County Probation
Center

County
Administration
Bldg.

Rene C. Davidson
U.S. Post Office
Edgewater
Berkeley
Courthouse
George D. Carroll
Courthouse

Juvenile Detention

1111 Ward Street

725 Court St.
202 Glacier Dr.
625 Court St.
751 Pine Street

628 & 630 Escobar St.

649 Main St.
1020 Ward St.

815 Court St.
1010 Ward St.

825 Brown St.
1111 Third St.

2350 Old Sonoma Rd.
45 Civic Avenue

45 Civic Dr.

2060 Fairmont Dr.
5672 Stoneridge Dr.
321 Tuolumne St.

2020 North Broadway

640 Ygnacio Valley Rd.

661 Washington St.

400 Broadway

1221 Oak St.

1225 Fallon St.

201 13th St

7751 Edgewater Drive

2120 Martin Luther
King, Jr. Way

100 37th St.

16 Jeanette Prandi Wa

Amendment No. 2 1o Master Agreement No. MA 301110

Martinez

Martinez
Martinez
Martinez
Martinez

Martinez

Martinez
Martinez

Martinez
Martinez
Napa No Bid
Napa No Bid

Napa No Bid

Pittsburg

Pittsburg

San Leandro
Pleasanton
Vallejo
Walnut Creek
Walnut Creek
Oakland

Oakland

Oakland
Oakland
Oakland
Oakland

Berkeley
Richmond

San Rafael No Bid

X X X X

X X X X

Statewide Armored Car Services
With Dunbar Armored Inc.
Exhibit B -Pavment Provisions

$290.00

$290.00
$290.00
$290.00
$290.00

$290.00

$290.00
$290.00

$290.00
$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00
$290.00

$290.00
$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00
$290.00
$290.00
$290.00
$290.00

$290.00
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San Benito Family
Law Facility
New Holiister
Courthouse
Juvenile
Courtroom
San Benito
Courthouse
Los Gatos
Courthouse
Santa Clara
Courthouse
County
Administration
Bidg.

Jury Assembly
Room

Main Courthouse
Jail Courtroom
Water Street
Lease
Juvenile Court
Watsonvilie
Courthouse
Hall of Justice
(West)
Juvenile
Delinquency Court
Hall of Justice
(East)
Terraine
Courthouse
333 W. Santa
Clara - 6 DCA
Downtown
Superior Court
Famity Court
Historic
Courthouse
Notre Dame
Courthouse
Probate
investigators
Superior Court
Administration
540 E. Main Street
Stockton
Courthouse
French Camp
Juvenile Justice
Center

390 Fifth Street
335 West Street
708 Flynn Rd.
440 Fifth St.
14205 Capril Dr.

1095 Homestead Rd.

701 Ocean St.

701 Ocean Street
701 Ocean St.
259 Water St.

303 Water Street
3650 Graham Hill Rd.

1 Second Street
200 W. Hedding
840 Guadalupe Pkwy.
190 W. Hedding

115 Terraine St.

333 W. Santa Clara St.,
Suite 1060

191 N. First St.
170 Park Center Plaza

161 N. First St.
99 Notre Dame Ave

111 North Market St.

111 W. St. John #100 &
102
540 E. Main Street

222 E. Weber Ave.

535 W. Mathews Rd.

Hollister
Hollister
Holiister
Holiister
Los Gatos

Santa Clara

Santa Cruz

Santa Cruz
Santa Cruz
Santa Cruz

Santa Cruz
Santa Cruz

Watsonville
San Jose
San Jose
San Jose

San Jose

San Jose

San Jose
San Jose

San Jose
San Jose

San Jose

San Jose
Stockton

Stockton

French Cam

Amendment No. 2 1o Master Agreement No. MA 301110

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Statewide Armored Car Services

With Dunbar Armored Inc.

Exhibit B-Payment Provisions

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00
$290.00
$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00
$290.00

$290.00
$290.00

$290.00

$290.00
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Lodi Branch- Dept.

1

Lodi Branch- Dept.

2
Modular

Legal Bldg.
Ceres Superior
Court

Manteca Branch
Court

Manteca Modular
2: Courtroom
Manteca Modular
1: Office

Court
Administration -
Main Building
Self Help Center
Iris Garrett
Juvenile Justice
Correctional Co
Courtroom 10
Adobe

New Downtown
Merced
Courthouse

Old Court

Hall of Records
Department 16
Modesto Civil
Court

Modesto Main
Courthouse
Modesto Traffic
Court

Modesto Juvenile
Court

Tracy Modular 2:
Courtroom

Tracy Branch
Courthouse
Tracy Agriculture
Building

Tracy Modular 1
Support

Turlock Superior
Court

HOJ Trailers

215 W. Eim St.

315 W. Eim St.

891 Mountain Ranch
Rd.

891 Mountain Ranch
Rd.

2744 Second St.

315 E. Center St.

315 East Center St.

315 East Center St.

5092 Jones Street
5092 Jones Sireet

2840 W. Sandy Mush
Road

700 West 22nd Street
670 W. 22nd Street

2260 N Street

627 W. 21st Street
1100 | Street

801 11th St.

801 Tenth Street, Suite
400

800 11th Street

2260 Floyd Ave.

2215 Blue Gum Avenue
475 East Tenth St.

475 E. 10th St.

503 East Tenth St.

475 East Tenth St.

300 Starr Ave.
600 Administration Dr.

Lodi

Lodi
San Andreas

San Andreas
Ceres

Manteca

Manteca

Manteca

Mariposa
Mariposa

Merced
Merced
Merced

Merced
Merced
Modesto
Modesto

Modesto
Modesto

Modesto

Modesto
Tracy
Tracy
Tracy
Tracy

Turlock
Santa Rosa

Amendment No. 2 to Master Agreement No. MA 301110

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
Ne Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Statewide Armared Car Services
With Dunbar Armored Inc.
Exhibit B —Payment Provisions
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Main Adult
Detention Facility
2880 Cleveland
Avenue

3055 Cleveland
Avenue

Empire Annex
Hall of Justice

Juvenile Justice
Center

South Civic Center
Justice Center

Ft. Bragg Justice
Center

Gateway Business
Park

Lakeport Court
Facility

Lakeport Self Help
Center

City Hall Annex
County
Courthouse
Superior Court
(Wiliits)

Juvenile
Courtroom
Humboidt County
Courthouse
(Eureka)

Del Norte County
Superior Court
Del Norte County
Sheriff's Building
John Hayes
Memorial Veterans
Hall

Hoopa Courthouse
County Jail
Historic
Courthouse
Juvenile Hall
Juvenile Hall

Main St.
Courthouse

Bidg. C

Bill Santucci
Justice Center

Cameron Park

2777 Ventura Avenue

2880 Cleveland
Avenue, #7

3055 Cleveland Avenue
3035 Cleveland Avenue
600 Administration Dr.

7425 Rancho Los
Guilucos Rd.

7000A S. Center Dr.
76270 Grange St.

700 S. Frankliin St.
761 Bevins Street

255 N. Forbes St.

380 No. Main Street,
Suites 1 & J
11 English Street

100 N. State St.
125 E. Commercial

2002 Harrison Ave.

825 Fifth St.

450 'H' St.

650 5th St.

483 Conger St.
Highway 96

2775 Richardsoen Dr

101 Maple Ave
11270 'B' Ave
297 Fair Lane

495 Main St.
2850 Fairlane Court

10820 Justice Center Dr

3321 Cameron Park Dr.

Santa Rosa

Santa Rosa

Santa Rosa
Santa Rosa
Santa Rosa

Santa Rosa
Clearlake
Covelo

Fort Bragg
Lakeport

Lakeport

Lakeport
Petaluma

Ukiah
Willits

Eureka

Eureka
Crescent City

Crescent City

Garberville
Hoopa
Aubum

Auburn
Auburn
Placerville

Placervilie
Placerville

Roseville

Cameron Park

Amendment No. 2 to Master Agreement No. MA 301110

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Statewide Armored Car Services
With Dunbar Armored Inc.
Exhibit B—Payment Provisions
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Old Jail
(Department 9)
Traffic Court
1100 Main Street

4075 Cincinnati
Avenue
Erickson Bldg.

OCIT

Lorenzo E. Patino
Hall of Justice
Finance -Payroll-
HR

Credit Union Bidg.
800 Sth St.

770 L Street - JCC
Sac OGA

621 Capitol Mall -
3DCA

Gordon Schaber
Sacramento
Superior Court
Records Center
Carol Miller Justice
Center Court
Facility

William Ridgeway
Family Relations
Courthouse
Juvenile
Courthouse

2850 Gateway
Qaks - JCC AOC
North - Finance
2880 Gateway
Qaks - JCC AOC
North

2890 Gateway
Qaks - 3 DCA
2860 Gateway
QOaks - JCC AQOC
North - Finance
Yuba County
Courthouse

Chico Courthouse
Courthouse Annex
Courthouse/Sheriff
Station-Jail
Greenville Justice
Court

213 Third Street
601 Court St.
1100 Main Street

4075 Cincinnati Avenue
520 9th Street

799 G Street.
Sacramento

6511 St.

901 Y Street

800 H St.

800 9th St.

770 L Street, Suite 700
621 Capitol Mall

720 Ninth St.
3460 Business Dr.

301 Bicentennial Circle

3341 Power Inn Rd.
9605 Kiefer Road

2850 Gateway Oaks
Dr., Suite 300

2880 Gateway Oaks
Dr., Suite 150

2890 Gateway Oaks Dr.

2860 Gateway Oaks
Dr., Suite 400

215 Fifth St.
655 Oleander Ave.
532 Oak St.

100 Courthouse Square

115 Hw 89

Woodland
Woodland
Woodland

Rocklin
Sacramento

Sacramento
Sacramento
Sacramenio
Sacramenio
Sacramenio

Sacramento

Sacramento

Sacramento
Sacramento

Sacramento

Sacramento

Sacramento

Sacramento

Sacramento

Sacramento

Sacramento

Marysville
Chico
Colusa

Downieville

Greenville

Amendment No. 2 to Master Agreement No. MA 301110

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Statewide Armored Car Services
With Dunbar Armored Inc.
Exhibit B —Payment Provisions
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Nevada City
Courthouse

Nevada City
Courthouse Annex
Butte County
Courthouse
Juvenile Hall
Paradise
Courthouse

Historic
Courthouse
Courthouse West
Courthouse East

2400 Washington
Avenue
Courthouse Annex
Justice Center
Justice Center
Court Modular
Juvenile Hall
Main Courthouse
Shasta County
Superior
Court/Sheriff's
Station

Chester Civic
Complex
Superior Court at
Corning

Dorris

Happy Camp
Hayfork
Courthouse
Annex No. 2
Weed Sateliite
Court

Eddy Building
Siskiyou County
Courthouse
Barclay Justice
Center
Plumas/Sierra
Regional
Courthouse

Lassen County
Courthouse Annex
New Susanville
Courthouse

Access to Justice
Center

201 Church St.

201 Church St.

1 Court St.
41 County Center Dr.

747 Eliiot Rd.

526 West Sycamore St.
446 Second St.
463 Second St.

2400 Washington
Avenue, Suite 300
1500 Court St.
1655 West St.

1655 West Street
2680 Radio Lane
1500 Court St.

20509-C Shasta St.
222 First St.

720 Hoag St.
324 N. Pine St.
4th St.

6641 B State Hwy 3
445 Pine Street

550 Main St.

322 West Center Street
311 Fourth St.
205 S. East Street

600 South Gulling
Street

221 South Roop Street

2610 Riverside Drive

145 South Lassen
Street

Nevada City

Nevada City

Oroville
Oroville

Paradise

Willows

Yuba City
Yuba City

(o1~ o

Redding
Redding
Redding

Redding
Redding
Redding

Burney
Chester

Corning
Dorris
Happy Camp

Hayfork
Red Bluff

Weed

Yreka
Yreka

Alturas

Portola

Susanville

Susanvilie

Susanvilie

Amendment No. 2 to Master Agreement No. MA 301110

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Statewide Armored Car Services
With Dunbar Armored Inc.
Exhibit B—-Payment Provisions
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Tulelake Satellite
Court

Tahoe City
Courthouse

Johnson Bidg.
Joseph Center
Santa Maria
Courts Bidgs C +
D

Sunnyvale
Superior Court

Morgan Hill
Superior Court

Court
Probation Agency
Juveniie

Courthouse

Probation Agency

Probation Agency

Oxnard DMV/Court

Window

Amendment No. 2 10 Master Agreement No. MA 301110
Statewide Armored Car Services

With Dunbar Armored Inc.

Exhibir B-Pavment Provisions

581 Main Street Tulelake No Bid

2501 North Lake Bivd. Tahoe City No Bid
South Lake

1354 Johnson Bivd. Tahoe No Bid

10075 Levone Ave Truckee No Bid

312 E. Cook St. Santa Maria No Bid

505 W El Camino Real  Sunnyvale

301 Diana Ave Morgan Hill

658 County Square Ventura

Dr#101

4353 Vineyard Ave Oxnard

1721 Pacific Ave Oxnard

Ste 140

1911 Williams Dr Oxnard

#175

4050 8. Saviers Rd Oxnard

Contractor's pricing assumes checks are
covered for reconstruction purposes.

Pickup and Delivery Times are subject to
mutual agreement

Same day delivery is contingent upon use of central cash vault at
mutually agreed upon location

The deposit contents of each pickup will not
exceed $100,000

No more than 3 items presented for pickup at
each location

ltem limits for consolidation locations can be
negotiated

Premise time will not exceed 6 minutes.

Time beyond 6 minutes will be charged at
$2.00 per additional minute. Contractor

shall work with Purchasing Group Members

$290.0C

$170.385

5171.57

$280.00

3171.37

$290.00
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Statewide Armored Car Services

With Dunbar Armored Inc.

Exhibit B —Payment Provisions

to minimize excess premise fees.
¢ Wil not require that weapons are surrendered
before entering the building.
» Pricing assumes award of a substantial
number of locations
« Monthly Rate includes pickup Monday through Friday (unless
otherwise noted) - no holidays
e Pricing assumes delivery to the bank's central
cash vault

2. Security dual compartment deposit bags are available for purchase from Dunbar BankPak at (800) 766-9145.
Pricing is as follows:

e SKU 917BPTB
Dual Compartment Bank Deposit Bag, clear fiim, 400 per box
9’ x17”
Price - $55 per/400
s SKU-1017BPTB
10" x 17” Dual Compartment Bank Deposit Bag, clear film, 400 per box
Price - $60/400

3. All pricing in the schedule above shall remain fixed for at least the one (1) year term of this Master Agreement,
as setforthin ara ra h2 Temn of Exhibit C Master A reement General Conditions. if the AOC elects to
extend the term of this Master Agreement, the AOC will use the proposed price adjustment factors applicable
during the option period(s) and the price adjustments will be set forth in a written amendment to this Master
Agreement. Any agreed-upon price adjustment may not exceed during any one (1) year option period the
Consumer Price Index as published by the U.S. Bureau of Labor Statistics.

4. Payment will be provided to Contractor by the Purchasing Group member as set forth in
Invoices and Pa ment of Exhibit C Master A reement General Conditions.

5. Purchasing Group members are exempt from federal excise taxes and no payment will be made for any
taxes levied on Contractor's or any subcontractor employee’s wages. Purchasing Group members will pay
for any applicable State of California or local sales or use taxes on the products provided or the services
rendered. All tax must be included as a separate line item on Contractor's invoice.

6. Contractor shall not charge nor shall the Purchasing Group members pay any overtime rate.

7 Contractor shall not request nor shall the Purchasing Group members consider any reimbursement for non-
production work including but not limited to time spent traveling to and from the job site or any living
expenses.

8. The fees paid by the Judicial Branch to the Contractor shall be at least as low as those fees charged by the
Contractor to its other customers in local and state government that are receiving substantially comparable
services at substantially comparable volumes over a similar period of time to the Services provided to the
Judicial Branch Group (“Government Contract”). The foregoing comparison shall take into effect total scope,
volume, geography to the extent that geography has a direct effect on the Contractor's actual costs),
services levels (when taken as a whole), technology, and assets associated with the services provided by
the Contractor in each case and any taxes and transition charges included within the charges for such
services. If, duringthe Term, the Contractor enters into a Government Contract contradicting the foregoing
sentence, the Contractor shall (a) give the Judicial Branch immediate notice of any such lower pricing, and
(b) offer to the Judicial Branch an immediate adjustment to the terms of this Agreement to reflect such lower
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Exhibit B —Payment Provisions

pricing. At least once each year during the Term, upon the Judicial Branch’s request and officer of the
Contractor shall certify to the Judicial Branch that this obfigation has not been contradicted by any
transaction entered into by the Contractor since the later of the (1) Effective Date and (2) date of the most
recent certification provided by the Contractor pursuant to this obligation.

In the event of a lost or destroyed deposit, Contractor will assume the fiability to pay for (a) all costs in
effecting the identification and replacement of the checks and (b) the face value of the checks not
reconstructed, except those checks which would not be collected at the time of loss, but not to exceed the
aggregate amount of $5,000 per shipment for unreconstructed checks. Contractor's maximum liability for
checks will not exceed the limit of $25,000 per shipment, which inciudes $5,000 for checks that cannot be
reconstructed. In the instance that cash is lost, the limits shall be $50,000 to $100,000.

END OF EXHIBIT B
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