
AMENDMENT NUMBER 

003 

FEDERAL EMPLOYER ID NUMBER 

52-0675776 

JUDICIAL COUNCIL OF CALIFORNIA 

MASTER STANDARD AMENDMENT COVERSHEET (rev 07-14) 

AGREEMENT NUMBER 

MA 301110 

All capitalized terms not defined in this amendment (the "Amendment") have the meanings given to than in the Agreement 
referenced above. As set forth in the Agreement, (the "Master Agreement"), the term "Contractor" refers to Dunbar Armored, 

Inc., and the term "Judicial Council", "AOC", or "State" refers to the Judicial Council of California.  

2. 	The title of this Master Agreement is: Armored Car Services. The parties agree that the Contractor will furnish to the 58 Superior 
Courts of California, the Appellate Courts, the Supreme Court of California, and the Judicial Council (individually referred to as 
a member of the "Purchasing Group" or "Customer"), services and materials as required in this Master Agreement. 
The title listed above is for administrative reference only and does not define, limit, or construe the scope or extent of the Agreement. 

3. This Amendment becomes effective on July 1, 2015 and expires June 30, 2016. 

4. The parties agree to amend the Master Agreement as follows: 

a. The purpose of this Amendment is to: i) exercise the third option term; ii) change the Contact information for the Judicial 

Council Contract Manager; and iii) update Exhibit B, Payment Provisions. 

b. Exhibit B, Payment Provisions, Revision No. 1, is hereby deleted and in its entirety and replaced with Exhibit B, Payment 

Provisions, Revision No. 2, attached hereto and incorporated herewith. 

C. Pursuant to Exhibit C, Paragraph 2, Term, the Judicial Council hereby exercises its option to extend the Master Agreement 
for the Third Option Tenn period beginning July 1, 2015 and ending on June 30, 2016. 

d. Exhibit C, Paragraph 23, Request; Communication; Notice (a) and (b), as amended is hereby deleted in its entirety and 
replaced with Exhibit C, Paragraph 23, Request; Communication; Notice (a) and (b), attached hereto and incorporated 
herewith. 

e. Contractor shall continue to provide Armored Car Services, including furnishing to the 58 Superior Courts of California, the 
Appellate Courts, the Supreme Court of California, and the Judicial Council (individually referred to as a member of the 
"Purchasing Group" or "Customer"), services and materials as required in this Master Agreement. 

f. The expiration date of the Master Agreement is hereby changed from June 30, 2015 to June 30, 2016. 

5. 	Except as provided in this Amendment, all terms and conditions of the original Agreement remain in full force and effect. 

JUDICIAL COUNCIL'S SIGNATURE CONTRACTOR'S SIGNATURE 

Judicial Co ncil of California 

CONTRACTOR'S NAME 0/ Contractor is not an mthralual person. state uhether Contractor IN 41 

(YirpOraii(111, partnership. etc) 

Dunbar Armored, Inc. 

II`, 	: 	!.:;,,,,,,, 	ndilayl 1).,vir BY I. intnori:eti S man 	-.1 II)  \ ll 

MINIM. )NA 	D' 11 :( 	SON M-0mi 
Stephen 	der, Man 
Business Services 

\\I)  

J. Patrick Frampton, VP 

Nooatiss 

Attn: Finance 	Business Services 
455 Golden Gate Avenue, 6th Floor 
San Francisco, CA 94102-3688 

‘DDRESS 

Attn: Rosemary Ayala 
50 Shilling Road 
Hunt Valley, MD 21031 
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The following list includes the provisions incorporated into Exhibit C, Paragraph 23, Request; Communication; Notice (A) 
and (B) pursuant to this amendment: 

23. 	Requests; Communication: Notice:  

A. All requests, communications and notices concerning this Master Agreement must be made through the Judicial 
Council's Contract Manager. Notice to the Judicial Council must be in writing and be delivered to the Judicial 
Council's Contract Manger at the following address by depositing in the U.S. Main or commercial express mail, 
first class and pre-paid with return receipt requested. 

Stephen Saddler 
Manager, Business Services 
Judicial Council of California 
455 Golden Gate Avenue, 6th Floor. 
San Francisco, CA 94102-3688 
Telephone: (415) 865-7989 
ste.phen.suldler@jud.ca.gov  

B. Any notice or information that is required to be delivered to the Judicial Council's Project Manager must be 
delivered to the following address: 

Stephen Saddler 
Manager, Business Services 
Judicial Council of California 
455 Golden Gate Avenue, 6th Floor. 
San Francisco, CA 94102-3688 
Telephone: (415) 865-7989 
stephen.saddlerOjud.ca,gov 

END OF LIST 
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EXHIBIT B 
PAYMENT PROVISIONS 

REVISION NO. I 

I. Pricing Schedule [REVISED] 

The price schedule beginning July I, 2015 through June 30, 2016 is set forth below. 

0  Lae Name Lee Address Lae City 

Delivers to the 
Minh 

132,11. Prier• Per 
Month, through 
June 30.2015 

Base Prier 
Per 310nth. 
beginning 

Jun 1.2015 

Net 
Change 

% 
Same 	text 
Dar 	Din 

I  David V. Kenyon Juvenile Justice Cana 7625 South Central Avenue Los Angeles S 	_290181 S 	291.45 

2 ('enrol Civil West Court 600 South Commomvealth Avenue Los Angeles s S 	290300 5 	291.45 0.5% 

3  Metropolitan Comthouse 1945 South Hill Street Los Angeles S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

4  Clam Shortridge Fob/ Criminal 1111SINV Center 2111 West Temple Street Los Angeles s $ 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

5  Central Arraignment ('ours 429 Bauchcl Street Los Angeles x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

6  Stanky Mosk Courthouse I I I North hill Street Los Angeles x $ 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

7  Hull of Reetuds 320 West Temple Stem Los Angeles x S 	290.00 $ 	291.45 0.5% 

It  Counts Records Center 222 North 1101 Street Los Angeles x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

9  300 5 Spring Street - 2 EWA I.5. 741 and Sur 300 S. Spring Street Los Angela a S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

10  East Los Angeles Courthouse 48411E. Civic Center Way Last Los Angeles S 	290.011 S 	291.45 0.5% 

II  West los Angeles (..tutrthouse 1633 Purdue AV1.111W IV',  Angeles S 	29000 5 	291.45 0.5% 

13  Small C141111%011111 . 99A 1633 Purdue ,Ave. Los Angeles x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

II  Former ltus Assembly 'books 1633 111111111C Ate. Los Angeles S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5'1i, 

14  Jury Assembly I railer 1633 Purdue Ave. Los Angeles S 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

15  1772 La Bai e A ',Mlle 1772 LaBaig Avenue Los Angeles S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

16  Hills wood I °unloose 5925 Hollywood Boulevan1 Los Angeles s 5 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

17  Eastlake Jusenik Corn 1601 Eastlake Avenue Los Angeles S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

18  Airport 1.38911139ne 11701 South la Cienega Boulaurd Los Angeles x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

19  Mental Health (loin 11511 North San Fernando Rood I AS Angeles x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

20  Beverly llills Courthouse 9355 Burns) War Beverly I lills x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

21  Compton Courthouse 200 West Conquon Hooks Ind l'ompton x 'S 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

22  Downey CourtInsterc 7500 East Imperial Highway Downey S 	290.00 $ 	291.45 0.5% 

23  Los Padrinos 'motile Court 7281 Emu Quill Drive Downey x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 11.5% 

24  Huntington Park Courthouse 6548 Mks Ascsnie Huntington Park S 	291300 5 	291.45 0.5% 

25  Malibu Courthouse 23525 Civic Center Was Malibu s 5 	290.110 S 	291.45 0.5% 

26  Redondo Brach t Ourthouse 117 Wad Torrance Boulevard Redondo Beach S 	290110 S 	291.45 0.5% 

27  Inglavoisd hivenik Court 110 Regent Street Inglewood x 5 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

28  high:wax, Courthouse One Regent Street Inglewood 5 	290E10 5 	291.45 0.5% 

29  Santa Monica Courthouse 1725 Main Street Santa Monica S 	290.00 $ 	291.45 0.5% 

30  S. Bay A411111 Court Jury Assembly Trailer 825 Maple Dr. Torrance 5 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

31  .lommise Courthouse 825 Maple Avenue 1 mono s 5 	290310 5 	291.45 0.5°. 

32  Torrance Anne. 3221 Tommee Boulevard Torrance S 	290.00 5 	29145 0.5% 

31  S. Hay Munictpul Traffic Court trailer 625 Maple Dr. Torrance S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

34  Whittia Courthouse 7339 South Painter As ems: Whittier 5 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

35  Norwalk 1'outthouse 12720 Norwalk Boulevard Norwalk S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

36  Catalina Courthouse 215 Sumner Avenue Avskin S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

37  IkllflowttCounhwrr 10025 East blower Street Bellflower 5 	2911.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

38  San Pedro COURITOUSC Annex 638 South !beacon Street San Pedro x $ 	290.00 S 	29145 0.5% 

39  San Pedro Courthouse 505 South Center Street San Pedro S 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

40 long 'knelt Courthouse 415 West Ocean HOIlleVaral long Reach S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 
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41  long Reach Courthouse Modular 415 W. Ocean Blvd. Tong bleach x $ 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

42  Momenta Training Center 300 W. Maple Ave. Monrovia x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

41  Monrovia Warehouse 250 W. Duane Road Monrovia x S 	29000 S 	291.45 0.5% 

44  Pasadena Courthouse 300 Fast Walnut Avenue Pasadena s S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

45  Glendale Courthouse 600 Late Bmadway Glendale x 5 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

40  Chabovorth Coorthouse 9425 Penfield A ,ctille Chatsworth a $ 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

47  San Fernando l'ourt home 900 third Street San Fernando v $ 	290.110 $ 	291.45 0.5% 

48  SvItnar Juvenile Gam 10350 Filbert Mem 

2 4757 Wen Valencia Boulevard 

Sylmar 

Santa Chaim 

N 

v 

S 	290.00 

5 	290.00 

S 	291.45 

S 	291.45 

0.5% 

0.5% 
49  Tanta I With Administrative Center 

50  Santa elatiln l'onrItIonsv 23747 West Valencia Floulevanl Santa Clain,' s S 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

51  Van Suss Counhcarsi Wen 144IM Erwin Street Mall Van Nuys x S 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

52  Van Nuys Courthouse East 6230 Sylmar A. ,nue Vim Nuys x 5 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

51  Burbank Counhouse 100 Fast (Nice Burbank x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

54  2255 N. l)ntario -1('C Judicial Council South 2255 N. Ontaho St.. Such 200 Burbank x 5 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

55  Chino Courthouse 13260 Central Ave. Chino x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

56  Rancho 4 'titanium/a Courthouse 8103 Haven Ave. Rancho Cummottga s S 	29000 S 	291.45 0.5% 

5 7  Randal Juvenik 'traffic Coon 9567 Arrow Ave. Ste. E. Bldg. I Rancho Cucamonga x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

NI  Fl Monte. Courthouse 11234 Fast Valley Boulevard El Monte . 5 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

59  Edmund D, EtIdmAIn Children*, Court 201 Centre Plain Deice Monterey Park x S 	290.1K) S 	291.45 0.5% 

60  Pomona Courthouse North 350 West Missive, Boulevard Pomona v. S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

ril  P01110ORCourthouse South 400 Civic:. Center Plaza Pomona v S 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

62  411 Fast Foothill Malley and 433 Eau Foothill Boulevard, Building I) Sail Dimas v 5 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

61  51 est Covina t'ounhouse 1427 West t'ovina Partway West Covina x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

M  Alhambra Courthouse 150 West Commonwealth Avenue Alhambra s S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

65  South t ouniv Regional I 'enter 500 Thud Ave. ('hula Vista . S 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

66  I avt I. 'malty Regional ('enter 250 E. Main St. 1.1 Caton a S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

67  Ranson Courthouse 1425 Monmeito Rd. Rs. 	u x S 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

MI  Trader • Dept 14 325 South Melrose Ihyve Vista 5 	290,00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

69  North County Regional Center • Annex 325 South Metals.: Drive Vista 5 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

70  North Colin>,  Hcwomal Center - South 325 South Melrose Drive Vista 5 	2911.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

71  nailer - Dept 35 325 South Melrose Drive V ista 5 5 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

72  Trader - Family Support 325 South Melrose Drive Vista S 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

73  Nut* County Regional Center - North 325 South Melrose Drive Vista S 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

74  Family (tun 1501-1555 Sixth Aye San Diego 5 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

75  County t.'ounhouse 220 West liroadway San Diego S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

76  Ilan of Justice 330 West Broadway San Diego S 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5!. 

77  Madge Bradley Bldg 1409 Fourth Ave Scut lbego S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

78  750 11 Street - 4 In'A 1 750 B Street. Suite 100 San Diego S 	290.481 5 	291.45 0.5% 

79  DerkIIIIII,111 Ili Trailer 2851 Meadowlark Dr. San Diego S 	290181 S 	291.45 0.5% 

KO  Department II 2901 Meadowlark Dr, San Diego 5 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

81  Kearns Mew Traffic Court K615 & KM6 Trailer 8950 Clairemont Mesa Blvd. San Diego S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

82  Elepartnical 9 Trailer 21151 Meadowlark Dr. San 1)iego S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

ID  Kearny Menu Traffic Court KM3 Trailer 8950 Claimmont Mesa Blvd. San Diego S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

144  Kearny Musa Traffic ('asst KM4 Trailer 89.50 l'Ithremont Mesa Blvd. San Diego S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

85  Juvenile Court 2851 Meadowlark Dr. San Diego S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

86  Katmy Mesa Coon 14950 Clairmont Mesa Blvd. San Diego S 	290.00 S 	291.45 (1.5% 

87  12396 World Trade Drive 12396 World Trade Drive, Suite 215 San Diego S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

/04  IL 	Justine Center anion 46-200 Oasis Sloan Indio S 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

89 Anne?, Justice center (Indio) 82-675 Highway 111 Indio S 	290.110 5 	291.45 0.5% 
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Lot Name lax Address 1 -ne (113 

Delivery to the 
Rank 

SAW Price Per 
Strunk, through 
June 30, 2015 

SoM' Price 
Per l Ion the 
beginning 

full 1, 2015 

Nct  
t hange Same 	Next 

Ilan 	Da. 

90  huhu ( foully Atil iiiii iSII mu, c Centot )42-(175 Highway 111 who S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

91 Banning 135 N. Alessandro Banning x S $ 0.0% 

92 Bantam/WM.11 135 N. Alessandro Banning 0 S S 0.0% 

91  Slinger Court 619 N St. Sanger No Bid S S 0.0% 

94  Blythe l'ounhouse - Superior Coon 265 N. Broadway Blythe No Bid S S 0.0% 

05  Calexico Crain 415 Fourth Si Cahn isn No Bid S S 0.0% 

46  Jail Coon-F.Ir 'num 328 Applestill Rd. 1-1C'entni No Bid S S 0.0% 

97  Juvenile Gam 324 Applestill Rd. VI Centro No Rid S S 0.0% 

98  Imperial County t.nurthouse 939 W. Main St. I I Centro No 14,d S 5 0.0% 

99  H Conn, Coort or Valley Plata 1625 W. Main St El Cenuo No Hid S S 0.0% 

100  Joshua Tree l'ourthouse 6527 White Leather Rd. Joshua free No Bid S S 	- 0.11% 

101  Palm Springs Task Force 3700 Taches ah Dr, 0105, 106, 107 & 108 Palm Springs S 	171.37 S 	172.23 0.5% 

102  Palm Springs t 'otos 3255 E. I aliquot l .Onyrfl Way Palm Springs s 5 	171.37 S 	172.23 11.5% 

103  Winterhaven Coun 2124 Winterhav en Dr. Winterhaven No Bid S 5 0.0% 

101  Barstow lin entle Trtilliv 101 East klountain Vie. Street Barstow x S 	118.64 S 	119.23 0.5% 

105  Hanson COM thou.: 235 East Mottnlino Vie. Street Barstow x S 	118.64 S 	119.23 0.5% 

196  Big Bear t'ounhousc 477 Summit Blvd. Big hear Lake No Bid S S 	• 0.0% 

107  MC1111111Iealth 011ke and Counnaun 4041 N. Pepper Ave Colton S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

lin  Fontana ( nuithousc 17780 Amass lint Fontana x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

109  boniann Dry Assembly Itimin 1711311 Anus+,  Ave. Fontana S 	290381 S 	291.45 0,5% 

11(1  Fontana Iln Assembly Building 17782 Arrow BM. Fontana x S 	290.00 S 	29195 0.5% 

1 1 1  Hemel 880 N. Stale St. Hemet 0 5 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

112  Needles Courthouse( 'Fork's Office 1111 Balky St., l'ivie Center Complex Needles No Bid 5 S 	- 0.09. 

113  Needles Courihouse• Dept. x7-1 1111 Bailey Sr. Civic Center Complex Needles No Bid S S 	- 0.0% 

114  1776 Park Avenue 1776 Part Avenue, Suite 136 Redlands x $ 	290.110 S 	291.45 0.5% 

113  Redlands Courthouse 216 Brookside Ave. Redlands x S 	290,00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

116  Twin Peaks Courthouse 26010 State Highway 189 Twin Peaks No Bid 5 	- S 0.0% 

117  Viciorvilk Cour Ili ttttt el /co. \ - I 14455 Civic Dr. Victors Mc x S 	171.37 S 	172.23 0.5% 

118  766 S. Gifford 766 S. Gifford Avenue. Unit 2 San Bernardino S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

119  Distribution Center 770 S. Gifford Avenue San Bernardino S 	29000 S 	291.45 0.5% 

120  Faintly law COW . 1.X3S 655 West 2nd Street, Suite 200 San Bernardino x $ 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

131  San liemardino ("ourthotrte 351 N. Arrowhead Ave San Bernardino x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 03% 

122  San Bernardino Juvenile Traffic 175 Win( Fifth St. San Bernardino S 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

123  Juvenile Dependency Courthouse 860 0. (When St. San Bernardino x 5 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

124  luveittle Delinquency l'ounhouse 900 East WWI Si San Bernardino S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

125  F (9119.9t Canopus-Jusentle Conn 790 E. Gilbert St., Building 9 San Bernardino x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.59. 

126  E. (When t Umpos-Encal Ser. Kt,. 790 E. Gilbert St , Building 7 San Bernardino 5 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

127  Coon Executive Office 172 W. Third St.. 2nd FL San Bernardino x S 	290.00 5 	291.45 03% 

128  San Bernardino Courthoove - Annex 351 N. Arrowhead Ave San Bernardino S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5'. 

129  E. Gabon Campus-Court lechnokiity 790 0. (When St. Building 11 San Bernardino a S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.51: 

130  776 S. Gifford 776 S. Gifford Avenue San Bernardino x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 03% 

111  780 S. Gifford 780 S. ( iiffoni Avenue San Bernardino x $ 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

132  790S. Gifford 790 S. Gillian! Avenue San Bernardino x 5 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

133  Appellate & Appeals North Annex 401 North Arrowhead San Bernardino x 5 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

134  3389 12th Street - 4 DCA 2 3389 12th Street R Onside x 5 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

135  Simons Bitilding, 3610 Ilth St. Rnerside is S 	290.00 $ 	291.45 0.5% 

136  Family taw Court 4175 Main St. Rtvenide x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 03% 

137  Hall 	Justice of 4100 Main St. R is erside x S 	2911.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

138 Riverside Censer 3403 Tenth St 5101211 It nersule x S 	290,00 S 	291.45 0.5% 
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H  lair Name Lee Address tame Clay 

Deliscr, to the 
Hank 

Base Price Per 
lnnth. through 
lime 30, 21115 

Rasa Price 
Per %loath. 
beginning 

Jul, 1. 2015 

Net 
Change 

% 
Same 	Next 
Day 	Day 

139 g ,,,,,gtc pi, end,: 	Imlir, .Josigs; 9991 ('ount, Fans Road Riverside s S 	290.1M S 	291.45 0.5% 

140  Riverside Juvenile Justice Traders 9991 County Farm Road Riverside a S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

141  Riverside Jto elide Coon 9991 County Farm Rd. RiVaXilk X S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

142  Hawthorne School Civil 9174 Indiana Avenue Riverside x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

143  Moreno Valley 13800 Ileacock Blvd Moreno Valley a S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

144  Munich' Juvenile Dependency 38860 Sky Canyon Drive Murrieta a S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

145  Temecula 41002 Counts.  Center 1)r. 'Temecula x S 	290.00 S 	29145 0.5% 

146  Harbor Ja•tive C'enter-laistuna I lilts Facility 23141 Moulton Parkway 1 aguna Hills a S 	290.0(1 S 	291.45 0.5% 

147  Harbor hist KC ( 'entcr-Newpon Roach Facility 41,111 Jamboree Road Newport Beach a S 	290.1111 S 	291.45 0.5% 

148  West Justice Center 814141144 I Ith Si Westminster x S 	29000 S 	291.45 0.5% 

149  Central Justice ('enter. t .011 Comptes (utter 751 W, Santa Ana Blvd. Santa Ana it S 	290.1111 S 	291.45 0.5% 

150  Central Justice Center Ames 909 North Main St. Santa Ana a S 	290.00 S 	201.45 0.5% 

151  Central )11Sik.X: f 'entor 700 Civic Center Dr W. Santa Ana x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

152  60) W. Santa Ana 111,d - 4 ILA 3 601 W. Santa Ana 111,d Santa Ana x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

151  North Just iee Cents, 1275 N. Berkeley Ave. Fullerton x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.3% 

154  Fktty Lou lannoeuu, Jame, Center 341 The City Dr. Orange x 5 	290.110 S 	291.45 0.5% 

155  Computer Systems Trailer 331 The City Drive South ()range x S 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

156  ( \sum 505 S. Buena Vista Comma x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

157  200 F. Santa Clara .. 2 1)CA 6 200 li. Santa Clara St. Velln1111 No Bid S S 	- 0.0% 

191  Hall ofJustIce 800 S. V letOgin Ave. Ventura a 5 	319.00 S 	320.60 0.5% 

159  Past County Courthouse 3855 Alamo Street Simi Valley x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

160  Santa Sorban Jury Assembly Bldg 111/8 Santa Barbara Santa Barbara No Hid S S 0.0% 

161  Figuema Division I IS E. Figueroa St. Santa Barbara No Bid S S 0.0% 

162  Santa ltatixtra Cmin Trailer 118 F. Figueroa St. Santa Barbara No Did S S 0.0% 

161  Santa Barbara Juvenile (loll 4500 Hollister Ave. Santa Barbara No Bid S S 0.0% 

164 Avenal ('out 501 E. Kings St. Avenal No Bid S S 0.0% 

165  Coalinga Court 166 W. Flat Street Coalinga No Hid S S 0.0% 

166  Corcoran ( ouit 10(0) Chmenden Ave. Cott wan No Bid S S 0.11% 

167  Delano/Ned* Kern Court 1122 Jefferson St. Ikkuto No Bid s s o.o% 

Ito  Hanks,' MUMMA C 1426 South Drive I Ian fowl No Bid 5 S 0.0% 

169  Probation Building 1424 Forum Dr. Dept It Hanford No Bid S S 0.11% 

170  Hanford Building!) 1426 South Drive Hanford No Bid S S 0.0% 

171  Hanford Building A 1426 South Drive I laniard No Bid S S 0.0% 

172  Frasi Kern Cowl-lake Isabella Branch 7046 Irate Isabella Blvd. Lake Isabella No Bid S S 0.0% 

173  Amin/ Lamont Branch 12022 Main St. Lamont No Bid S S 0.0% 

174  Tension. Superior Court 449 C St Lonoore No Bid S S 0.08s 

175  New Porterville Courthouse Ponemille No Hid S S 0.0% 

176  Portervilk Courthouse 87 E. Morton Ave. Porten ille No Bid S S 0.0.: 

177  ShallorAVaseo Courts Bldg. 325 Central Valky Hwy Shatter No Bid S S n.o% 

178  Tali Crams lildg. 311 N Lincoln Si. Taft No Bid S S 0.0% 

179  Tan Superior Court Modular 311 N Lincoln Street Tall No Bid S S 0.0% 

180  Tulare IN, iston 425 F. Kern ST Tulare No Bid S S 0.0% 

181  Talmo: Fanolv law Facilitator 3400 West Mineral King Ave. Visalia No Bid $ S 0.0‘k 

110  Visalia Comention Center 303 last Accquia V isalia Mn Bid S S 0.04. 

183  Visalia Superior Court 221 South Mooney Blvd. Visalia No Bid S S 0.0% 

184  Adult Pre-trial (Wort 366111 Road 112 Visalia No Hid S S 0.0% 

it45  William Silveria Jr. Juvenile Justice Center 1 121111 Ave. 368 Visalia No Bid S S 0.0% 

186  Tullio: Family law Conservatorship 3400 Wed Mineral King Ave. Visalia No Bid 5 S 0.0% 

187 430 bloom Avenue 930 Truman Avenue Bakersfield No Bid S S 0.115'. 
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Judicial Council of California Standard Master Agreement 
Amendment No. 003 to Master Agreement No. MA 301110 with Dunbar Armored, Inc. 

Lae Name Lee Address Let Oh.  

Delivery to the 
Batik 

Kase Price Per 
Month. through 
lune 30, 21115 

Saw 	Next 
Dar 	Day 

1tat Bakersfield )astir Bldg 1215 1 mom MI:. Bakersfield No Bid 

189 Bakersfield Superior Coon 1415 irustun Avenue Bakersfield No Bid S 

190 Bakersfield Juvenile Colter 2100 College Ave. Bakersfield No Bid S 

191 Bakersfield Juvenile tinter 2001 (*allege As c. Bakersfield No Kid S 

192 Arnow Street .1131 3131 Arnaw Street Bakersfield No Bid S 

193 Veterans Mammal !this. 801 Grand As-e. San Luis Obispo No Bid S 

194 Jusentk Services Colter 11165 Kansas Ave San Luis Ohniso No Hid S 

195 1070 Palm St. 1070 Palm St. San Vol,. Obispo No Hid 5 

19h 1120 Mill Si. 11211 Mill St. San Luis Obispo No Bid S 

197 Couttliuuse Atones 1035 Palm Si. San Luis Obispo No Bid $ 

198 tiros err Ileach Brooch 214 S 16th St. (lower Beach No Bid S 

199 Lompoc Division 115 Civic Center Plata twnr,,, No Bid S 

2I10 Pam. It °hies Courthouse 901 Park Street Paso Robles No Bid s 

101 Miller Street Lease 201 S. Miller Street Santa Maria No Bid S 

702 Soma Maria kasha,. Court (nen 7 4205 California Blvd. Santa Maria No Bid S 

203 2601 Skyway !Sive 2601 Skyway Dote. Suite A2 San). Maria No Hid S 

204 Soh am  Superior ( can 1745 Mission Once Sok ang No Bid S 

205 Maio:cf14my Adohnieyalin Bldg 1775 Hwy. 58 Mojave No Bid S 

2116 %knave Super-kw Court Slodulat 1773 Highway 58 Moja% c No Hid $ 

207 Moiave.Main C'ourt Facility 1773 Hwy. 58 Mojave No Hid s 

208  Fieporiment 4 301 West Line Bishop No Bid S 

209 1 	It 	t 	I  my° St  ...kn.,' ..Ourtionse 168 N. Edwanls Independence No Had S 

210 Superior Court 2 345 South (lay Street Independence No Bid S 

211 Michael D. Anima. kb Antekipe Valley Courthouse 42011 4th Street West Lancaster No Bid S 

212  Alfred L McCourtney Jai-nine holm: Center IMO Went Anemic J lancusber No Bid S 

211 Mono Superior Court 452 Old Mammoth Rd. Mammoth Lakes No Bid S 

214  New Mammoth lakes Courthouse Main Street and Sierra Park Road Maninkith I likes No Bid S 

215 lihigoers7w - !Jive:ion H ( vodrooni 4211 N China Lake Hind. Ridgeerest No Hod S 

116 Ridgecrest- Slain Facility 132 EMI Cacti St. Ridgecrest No Bid S 

217 Sierra Courthouse 40601 Road 274 Bass lake No Bid S 

210  lira is Court 10115th St. Ckwis No Bid S 

219 (Snubs Division of the Tulare Superior ('our) 640 South Alta Ave. Dinuha No Bid S 

220 Firebaugh Court 1325 0 St. Firebaugh No Bid S 

221  Fowles Court 127 F. Moored Foss kr No Bid 5 

222 Kingsburg Court 1600 California St. kingshure No Bid S 

1 138."7C(8871008, 445 I Street t ors Hama No Bid S 
223  

224 

-all 

Madera (*mons Superior Coon 209 W. Yosemite Ave. Moine No Hid S 

225  Madera Modular 1 209 W. Yosemite,  Ave. Madera No Bid S 

226 Missions Building 7601 Street Madera No Bid  s 

227   Sladeni Jui mile Court 28219 Avenue 14 Madera No Hal S 

210  Headley Court 815 Cr St. Reedley No Bid S 

229  Selina Court 2424 McCall Avenue Selina No Hid $ 

230  2424 Ventura Shim - 5 DCA 2424 Veniura Street Fresno No Bid 5 

211 North Annex Jail 1255 51 St. Fresno No Bid S 

732 Juvenile Dependency 1745 -1255 Fulton Mall Fresno Nu Bid S 

2i  t Family Support 222(1 Tulin,: St Fre sun No Bid S 

234  Catitbknea 2317 Tuolumne Street Fresno No Bid S 

235  1999 Tuolumne 1999 TUOIWIVIC Street Fiv,no No Bid S 

236 *rano County Coorthonse 111* Van Ness Ave. Fresno No Hid S 

Base Price 
Per Month. 	Set 
beginning 	( lunge 

Jul. 1, 2015 	0. 

S 	- 	0.11% 

S 	 0.05. 

s 	0.0% 

5 	 11.0% 

s 	 0.05. 

S 	 0.0% 

S awe 

S 0.05. 

S 0.0% 

S 0.12. 

S 004 

S 00% 

S 11.0% 

S 0.0% 

S 0.0% 

S 0.0% 

S 0.0% 

S 0.07. 

S 0.11% 

S OA% 

S 013% 

S 0.0% 

S 0.0% 

S 0.0% 

S 0.0% 

S 0.0% 

5 0.0% 

S 0.0% 

S 0.0% 

S 0.0% 

S DIP. 

S 0.0% 

S 0.0% 

S 0.0% 

S 0.11% 

S 0.0% 

S 0.0% 

$ 0.0% 

5 0.0% 

S 0.0% 

S 0.0% 

S 0.11% 

5 0.0% 

S 0.0% 

S 0.0% 

S 00% 

S 0.0% 

5 0.0% 

5 00% 
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Judicial Council of California Standard Master Agreement 
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11 toe Name lot Address lac Clic 

Delivery to the 
Rank 

Bane Price Per 
Month. through 
June 30, 2015 

Kase Pelee 
Per Month. 
beginning 

Juls I. 2015 

Nei 
Change 

% 
Seine 
Das 

Next 
Dos 

217 Llt ' Delinquent, I Oini .1 .i.t 1-. 	Amok:on Avenue Vt1,11(1 No Nut S S Orlt% 

218 saline. Coutthouse- North Wing 24111'hurch St. Salinas No Bid S S 0.11r, 

2)9 168 We* Alisal 16$ West Alisal Salinas No Bid S S 0.0% 

240 Salinas Modular .1 Cowin-aim 240 ('hutch Sued Salinas No Bid S S 0.11% 

241 Juvenile Courthouse 1422 Natividad Rd. Salinas No Bid S S 0.0% 

242 King City Cisinhouse 150 Enindsoui Way King City No Bid S 5 0.0% 

243 Marina Couithorne 3180 Del Monte Blvd, Manna No Hid S 5 0.1154 

244 Midis:icy Courthouse 1200 Aguolito Rd. Monterey No Bid S S 0.05a 

245 Ibill ■1(.111Silt, 400 Crninly Center Redwood City x S 	240,00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

246 San Mateo IT 399 linalliad Sired, Suite 1115 Redwood (-ay x 5 	29000 5 	291.45 0.5% 

247 Traffic -  Small Claims Annex 500 (..ounts Center Redwood City x S 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

248 Northern Brunch C'oterthoirsc 1050 Mission Rd. South San Francisco x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

249 Sliwthon Brandi Jail Annex 1050 Mission Rd. South Sim Francisco x 5 	290.00 $ 	291.45 11.5% 

250 Sunnyvale (rnlah,cse 605 W. U.1 Canino Real Sunnyvale a S 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

251 Polk St Annex 575 Polk St, San Fnmeisco x 5 	290.00 S 	291,45 0.55a 

252 t -ivie Court Courthouse 400 McAllister St. San FIllfleitA3) X S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

253 455 Golden Gate - WC Judicial Council Bay Area 455 Golden Gate Avenue San Francisco x 5 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

254 150 McAllister • Sup CI and 1 RCA 350 McAllister San Frandsen x S 	290.00 5 	291,45 11.55a 

255 Mill of histice 850 Bryant St. San Francisco x $ 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

256 50 First Strew - 11CR1' Stg 1 511 First Street San Frandsen, X S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

257 .103 Second Sited • NCR(' 303 Second Street, 4th Flow San Francisco) a $ 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

258 Faintly Justice Centel Sue - likig 1 175 Woodside As mac Sun handset. x S 	291100 S 	291.45 0.5% 

259 Family Justice Center Site - Bldg 3 575 Woodside Avenue San Francisco x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

260 Family Justice Center Site • KW 2 375 Woodside Avenue San Francisco a S 	290,00 $ 	291.45 0.5% 

261 Youth 1 inidatice Center 375 Woodside Ave. San Francisco x S 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

261 Family Justice Center Woodside Ave. and Portola San Francisco x S 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

263 Pub 	Alto Courthouse 270 Grant Sr Palo Alto x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

264 Crntral Branch 00)) North 161,1160h Si. San Mateo x $ 	290320 $ 	29145 0.5% 

265 Juvenile Winch, Paul Scannell [Hive 222 Paul Scannell Drive San Mateo x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

266 (11.`11MC E. McDonald Hall of honks: 2233 Shoreline Drive Altimeds x S 	29000 5 	191.45 0.5% 

267 Concord-Mt Diablo District 2970 Willow Pam Rd. Concord x $ 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

268 1.11.' and Justice ('enter 530 Union Ave. Fairfield No Bid S S 0.05, 

269 ( tall of Justice 600 Union Ave. Fairtiekl No Bid S S co% 

170 Vat-morn hull of Jusiice 39419 Pawn Padre Pkwy, Fremont x S 	29(4.00 S 	291.45 11.5% 

27) Hayward Ilall of Justice 24405 Amador St. Hayward x S 	290.00 S 	29145 0.5% 

272 Winton Bldg, 224 W Winton Ave. Hayward x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

273 14k Unit 1111 Ward Stns./ Martinez x 5 	290.011 5 	291.45 0.5% 

274 Wakefield Taylor Courthouse 725 Court St. Martinez x S 	2911.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

275 Juvenile Hall 202 Glacier Dr. Martinez x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

276 Finance Building 625 Court St. Martinez x S 	290.00 5 	291.45 0,5% 

277 Family Law Center 751 Pine Street Martinez x 5 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

278 Facilities & Systems 628 & 630 Fsvohar St. Martinez x 5 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

279 Executive Administration 649 Main St. Martinez x 5 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

280 !tray Courts 1020 Ward St. Martinez a S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.55. 

281 Archival Records • Posi Office 815 Court St. Martinez x S 	290,00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

2112 Jail Annex IWO Ward St. Martinet x S 	29000 S 	291.45 0.5% 

210 iliatoric Counhouse 2125 Brown St. Napa No Bid S S 0.0% 

2114 Criminal Coon Buikling 1111 Third St. Napa No Bid $ S 0.0% 

2145 Napa Juvenile t'ouri 135110ki Sonoma Rd, Napa No Hid S S OAPs 
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Judicial Council of California Standard Master Agreement 
Amendment No. 003 to Master Agreement No. MA 301110 with Dunbar Armored, Inc. 

II Inc Name Lee Addrms Lot (16. 

Delitery to the 
Hank 

Kase Price Per 
Month. through 
June 311, 2015 

RIM Price 
Per Ilan h. 
beginning 

Jut. 1, 2015 

Nei 
( hange 

a. 
Same 
Day 

Nest 
Hat 

2316 Pinstamplkita 45 Corr A‘eflUc l'1114,01 m $ 	290,110 5 	291.45 0 5".. 

2(17 Pittsburg-Delta Modular 45 (irk Dr. Pittsbory x $ 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5". 

21113 John (ieorgt Psychiatric Pavilion 2060 Fainnont Or. San Leondro x 5 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

2119 Oak - Schenone Hall or Justice 5672 Stoncridge (Sr. Pkasamon x S 	290AM) S 	291.45 0.5% 

29)1 Solana Justice Building .121 Tuolumne Sr. Va/kjo x S 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

291 2020 North Broadway 2020 North Broadway Walnut Creek z S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

292 Danville District Courthouse 640 Ygnacio Valley Rd. Walnut ('reek S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.55a 

293 Wiky W. Manuel (Outhouse 661 Washington Si Oakland $ 	290.00 $ 	291.45 0.51. 

294 County Prohrtion Center . 400 RIValilkay Oakland x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

295 County Administnttion fikla 1221 Oak Si. Oakland x 5 	290.00 S 	29145 0.5% 

296 Rene C. Davidson 1225 Falba Si. Oakland x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

297 U.S Post ()Mee 201 13th Si, Oakland N S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

NS Inlyowatcr 7751 Edgewater lkive Oakland s S 	290.00 S 	291,45 0.5% 

299 Berkeley Courthouse 2120 Martin Lather King, Jr. Way Berkeley x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

500 (Mow D, Carroll ("mellow 100 37th Si, Richmond S 	290,00 5 	291.45 0.5'. 

MI Juvenile Iktentton 16 Jeanette Pouch Way San Rafael No BM 5 5 	. 0115,. 

Auz San Benito Family Law Facility 390 Filth Street Hollister No Bid S S ((.0'. 

303 New Ilollister Coorthoust 335 West Street Hollister No Bid S S 0.0•x. 

304 Juventle Courtroom 7013 Flynn Rd. Holltsicr No Hid S S 0.11% 

305 San floino Courthouse 440 Fifth Si. Hollister Na Bid S S 0.0% 

306 Loa Gams Courthouse 14205 Capril Dr,. Los Gatos No Bid 5 S 	- 0.0% 

307 Santa Clara Courthouse 1095 Hommtead Rd. Santa Clara 5 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

30a County Administration Bldg. 701 Ocean St Santa Cruz. No Bid S S (Lira 

309  Jury Atlas-misty Roth 701 Ocean Sinai Santa Cruz No Bid S S 0.0% 

310 Main t 'otaihouse 71)1 Ocean St. Santa Cruz No Hid S S 0.0% 

311 Jail Courtroom 259 Water St. Santa Cruz No Bid S S 0.0% 

312 Water Street Leak 303 Water Turret Santa Cruz No Bid S S 0.0% 

311 Juvenile Court 3650 Graham Hill Rd. Santa Cruz s 5 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

314 Watsonville Courthouse 1 Second Street Watsonville No Bid S S 0.0% 

115 (tall or justice (Wear) 200 W. Iledding San low x S 	290.00 $ 	29145 053 4 

3I6  lovciuk lkIniquency Court 1340 Guadalupe Pkwv. San Jose x S 	29000 5 	291.45 0.5% 

117  I tall of Justice 3Eastt 190 W. Bedding San Jose 5 	290.00 S 	291.45 03% 

SIR  Tennant Courthouse 115 Tenatne St San Jose S 	290.00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

319  333 W. Santa Clara - 6 (WA 333 W. Santa Clara Si.. Suite 1060 San Jose z S 	291300 $ 	291.45 03% 

320  Downtown Superior Court 191 N. First St San Jos.e 5 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5% 

321  Family Court 170 Park Center Plaza San Jose x S 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.55$ 

322  Historic Courthouse 161 N. Firra St. Sall arse S 	290.09 S 	291.45 0,5% 

323  Notre Dame Courthouse 99 Notre Dame Ave San Jaw x S 	290.00 S 	29145 0.5% 

324 Probate Investigators I I I North Market Si San Jour x S 	29000 5 	291.45 0.5% 

.125  Superior Court Adtnintstration III W. St. John #100 & 102 San .10,W x $ 	290.00 S 	291.45 0.5.74 

326 540 E. Main Street 540 E. Main Street Stockton No Bid S S 0.0% 

1?7  Stiotktort Counhoost 222 F. Wolter Ace. Stti•khm No Bid S S 0,11% 

32K French Camp Juvenile Justice Center 535 W, Mathews Rd. French Camp No Bid 5 S 0.0% 

329  loth Manch,  Dept, 1 215 W, Mtn St. Lodi No Bid S S 11.11% 

KIO  1,4%11 Branch- Uteta 2 315 W, Elul St Lodi No Bid S S 0.011,, 

Al I  Modular 091 Nl,tiiti,ouo Rallt'll ltd. San Andreas No Bid s S tor'. 

332 Legal 131t1g, /191 Mountain Ranch Rd. San Andreas No Bid 5 S 0.0", 

311 Care a Superior Court 2744 Second SI, C'ercs No Bid 

334 Monlecn firemen (burl 315 F. Center St. Stant era No Hod 110"s 
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N Inc Name Lot Address Inc. 	Cliv 

Delivery 111 (he 

Hank 

Base Price Per 
Month. through 

tune 311, 21(15 

Rase Price 
Per Month, 

beginning 

Jut* 1,2015 

Nei 
Change Same 	Nest 

Day 	Day 

533 M31110.11 MOdUllit 2. Courtmoin 315 East ('enter St. MIIIIICCH No Rid s. 0.0% 

336 Manteca Modular I: Office 315 East Center St. Manteca No Bid S 0.0% 

317 Court Administration - Main Building 3092 Jones Steed Niariposa No Bid S 0.0% 

.118 Sett Help Center 51192 Jones Street Mariposa No Hid S 0.0% 

339 Iris CiturettlitNettile 1WiliCe Correctional Co 2840 W. Sandy Mush Road Merced No Bid S 0.0% 

340 Countoom It) 700 Weft 22nd Surto Menasi No Bid $ 0.0% 

.41 Adobe 670 W. 22nd Sheet Menet No Hid S 5 0.11% 

34? Neu IN,  moon Moped 	01011100W 2260 N Street Men:ed No Bid S S 0.IP/e 

41  old Court 627 W. 21st Steed Merced No lid S S 0.0% 

344 Hall of Reeinds 1100 I Street Modesto No Hal S S 0.0% 

345 Department 16 801 I Id' St. Modesto No Rid $ 0.0% 

346 Modem's Civil Court 801 Tenth Street, Suite 400 Modesto No Bid S 0.0% 

347 Mislesto Main Courthouse 800 I I tit Street Modesio No Hid S S 0.0% 

34,5 Modesto 1 rank Court 2260 Floyd Ave. Modesto No Rid S S 0.0% 

549 Modesto )1,1\ Cllik Coon 2215 RIM Ginn ANuItsse NiOlk,10 No Hid S 5 0.0% 

1.50 Tracy Modulus 2 t'puttroxam 475 East 'tenth Si. I-raey No Hid S 0.0% 

331 Tracy Branch Courthouse 475 E. 10th St. tracy No Rid S. 5 0.0% 

352 Tracy Agriculture Budding 503 East -tenth Si. Tracy No Bid S S (1.0% 

331 Tracy Modolar I • Support 475 East tenth Si. Tracy No Hid S 0.11% 

354 Thilook Suparxv Cowl 3(10 Starr Ave. Turlock No Hid $ 5 0.0% 

355 1103 Trailers 600 Administration Dr. Santa ROMA NO Bid S S 0.0". 

336  Mam Adult Detention eictHts 2777 Ventura ANcIIIIc Santa Rosa No Bid S 0.014 

357 2880 Cleveland Avenue 2880 Cleveland Avenue, 07 Santa Rosa No Bid S S 0.0% 

358 3055 Cleveland Aseptic 3055 Cleveland Avenue Santa ROW No Bid S 

359 Futon: Annex 3033 Ckvelarid Avenue Santa Rosa No Rid S 

.560 Hall of Justice 600 Administration Dr. Santa Rosa No Bid S S 011 

361 litsvnite Justice Caws 7425 12:111C1/0 LOA Ciuilocex Rd. Santa Rosa No Hid S S 0.9% 

.162 south Cu is ('onion 71100A S. Center Dr. Clcarlake No Hid S 

34,3 Justice Center 76270 Grange St. Covelo No Bid S 

364 It Ifragg itmiie Center 7(10 S. Franklin St. Fon Bragg No Bid S 

W  Galena,: Business Park 761 Bevies Street Lakeport No Bid S S 0.0% 

366  Lakeport Court Facility 255 N. Forbes SI. Lakeport No Bid S S 0.0% 

167  Lakeport Self !kip Cetner 380 No. Main Street, Suites I & I Lagemin No Bid S S 0.0% 

168  Cily Hall Annex I I English Street Pendant,' No Hid S $ 0.0% 

360 C'o umy Courthouse 100 N. State St. Ukiah No Bid S 0.0% 

370 Superior Court (Willits) 125 F. Conunercial Willits No Bid S S 0.0% 

371 iussatile Courtroom 2002 Benison Ave. Eureka No Hid $ Oft% 

372 I lumboidt County Courthouse (Eureka) 825 Fifth St. Eureka No Bid S 

373  Del Norte County Superior Court 450'H' St. Crescent Coy No Bid 5 OAP. 

374  Del Norte County Sheriffs Building 650 5th St. Crescent City No Bid S S 	- 0.1r „ 

375  John Hoye: Memorial Veterans Hall 483 Conger St. Garbenoille No Bid S OA% 

376  Hoopa Courthouse Highway 96 Hopp No Bid S 

377  County Jail 2775 Richardson Dr Auburn No Bid S 0.0% 

376  Historic t'ourthouse 101 Maple AVC Auburn No Bid S OM% 

379  Juvenile Hall 1127013' Ave Auburn No Rid S S 	- 0.1140 

liki ili.:1111C Ball 297 Fair Lane Phicervtlk No Bid S 

381 Main St, Courthouse 495 Main St. Placerville No Bid S 0.0% 

382 Bldg. (:' 2850 Fairiane Coon Placerville No Bid S S 0.0% 

MI 13111 Santucci Smiler CORO 101120 Justice Coos Dr Rosevilk No Rid S S 0.11% 
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8  Inc Name Lee Address tale CHI. 

Delbert to Ow 
Rank 

Base Price Per 
Month. through 
Flow 30. 21115 

Bair Prier 
Per Monih, 
beginning 

Ails I, 2015 

Sel 
Change 

7. 
Same 	Nest 
Itat 	Bat 

184  ('motion Pink 3321 Cameron Park Dr. ('ammo Pad, No Ititi s 	- 5 0.01% 

385 Old Jail (Department 9) 213 Third Street Woodland No Bid S S 0.0% 

186 Traffic Court 601 Court Si. Woodland No Bid S S 0.0% 

387   111)0 Mom Street 1100 Main Street Woodland No Bid S S 0.0% 

388   4075 Cincinnati At caul/ 4075 Cincinnati Avenue Rocklin No Bid S S 0.0% 

389   Erickson Bldg, 520 9th Street Sacramento No Bid S 5 0.0% 

190  0(1T 799 (i Street. Sacramento Sacramento No BM S S 0.1155 

191   I moot,  F. Patin° Hall of !mince 651 I Si. SNCrarreetittl No Bid S 5 0.0% 

192  Finance -Pa/161l-11R 901 H Street Sacramento No Hid $ S 0.0% 

391  Credit ('moo Hdlg 800 H St. Sacramento No Bid S '5 0.0% 

394  800 901 St. Mal 9th St. Sacramento No Bid S S 0.0% 

195  770 I. Still - /CC Sac O(IA 7701. Streo, Suite 700 5:14:111111011t1  No Bid S S 0.0% 

196  621 Capitol Mall •.1 I/CA 621 Capitol Mall Sacramento No Hid S S 0.0% 

397   (iordon Schaper Saerantento Superior Coon 720 Ninth St. Sacramento No Bid S S 0.0% 

IQ%  Rotords Cotter 1460 Bthialltll Dr. Sacramento No Bid S S 0.10. 

SW  ( 'still Miner lustue I 'ono C Mat Facility 301 Bicentennial Circle Sacramento No Hid S S OAPs 

4011  William Ridgeway hinds 1(elations Courthouse 3341 Power Inn Rd. Sacra:nem° No Bid S S 0.0% 

401  Juvenile Counhouse 4605 Kiefer Road 5.1teramento No Bud S S 0.0% 

402  2850 ( /mew ay Oaks • .111' North • Finance 2100 ( tatettiON' Oak, Or.. Suite 100 Sacramento No Bid S '. 0.11% 

401  2880 (iineway (bikt - 	Noith ,1('C 21040 Oateway ( kik, Dr.. Sully 15(1 SttefillTlet110 No Hid $ 3 0,0% 

.101  28911(iateway Oaks - 1 DCA 2890 Gateway Oaks Dr. Sacramento No Bid S S 0.0% 

4(15  22161 ((airway (Faits -11'1' North - Finance 2860 (iateway Oaks Dr.. Suite 400 Saentiticsati NO Bid $ S 0.11% 

400   Yuba County Courthouse 215 Fifth St. Marys. ilk No Bid S S 0.09. 

407  Chico Courthouse 655 Oleander Ave Chico No Bid S S 0.0% 

408   Coorthouse .Annex 532 Oak Si. Colima No Bid S 5 0.0% 

409   CourthouseNhcriff Station-Jail 100 Counhouse Square Downieville No Bid S S 0.0% 

410   Greenville Justice Court 115 Hwy 89 Orem Ole No Bid S S 0.0% 

411   Nevada t nv l'ounhoute 201 Church St blesada City No Hid S S 0.0% 

412  Nevada Cite Courthouse Annex 201 Church St. Nevada City No Bid S S 0.0% 

411  Butte C011111.■ Courthouse I Court Si. Camille No Bid S S 0.0% 

414  linen& Hall 41 County Collo Sr.I Orcwille No Bid 5 S 0.0% 

415  Paradise ('eurthouse 747 Elliot Rd. Paradise No Bid S S 0.0% 

416  Himont: Courthouse 526 West Sycamore Si. Willows No Bid 5 S 0.0% 

417  Courthouse West 446 Second St. Yuba Cily No Hid 5 S (1.0!'. 

418  Courthouse Lust 463 Second Si. Yuba City No Bid S S 0.0% 

419  2400 Washington Atcritie 2400 Washington Avenue. Suite 300 Redding No Bid S S 0.0% 

420  Courthouse Annex 1500 Court St. Redding NO Hid S S 0.0% 

421  Justice timer 1655 Wen St Redding No Bid S S 0.05: 

422  lustive (Cuter Court Modular 1655 West Skeet Redding No Bid S S 0.0% 

.123  lincitile Hall 2680 Radio lane Redding No Bid 5 S 0.11% 

424   Main Courthousa: 1500 Court St. Podding No Bid S S 0.0% 

42S  Shama County Superior Courti•Shen  tr.  Station 205111-(' Shama St. Burney No lib/ S S 0.11% 

420   Cheater Civic Complvx 222 Final St. Chester No Bid S S 0.0% 

427  Superior Coun at Corning 720 Hoag St. Corning No Bid $ S 0.0% 

428  Dorn, 324 N. Pine Sr, Dorris No Bid $ S 0.0% 

429  Happy (*amp 4th St. Hangs Camp No Bid S S 0.0% 

430   I lavfock Courthouse 6641 B State Hwy 3 Hayfork No Bid S S 0.0% 

431  Annex No 2 445 Pine Street Red Bluff No Bid S S 0.0% 

412 Wo-s1 Satellite Court 150 Main St. Weed No Bid S S 0.0% 
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14  Inc Same log Atiiima lore Clay 

nighery In the 
Hank 

Kase Price Per 
Month. through 

lone 311, 2015 

Rase Price 
Per Slonth, 
beginning 

.111111 	I. 2015 

Set 
C hinge 

% 
Same 	5. est 

flay 

411 1-11tly Building 377 Wert Center Street Yreka siollivi . Y 

434 Siskiyou County Counbouxe All Fourth Si. Yreka No Bid S S (011.0%(1%  

433  1Mtvloy. lattice Center 205 S EMI Sueci Alturau No Bid S S 0.07. 

4414 PluntavSietra Regional I 'ioirthoteo. 613 South Galling Street Ponola No Hid S 5 11.0% 

437 I  novo i'ounty Counhousc Annex 221 South Roop Street Susan,. ille No Bid S S 0.0% 

4311 Net Sit,otis ilk Coorthouse 7610 Riverside ante Stroativilk No (lid S S 0.05r. 

430 Axes, to Justice Center 14$ South 111550(1 Sheet SWIM,. ilk No Hid S $ 0.03. 

440 Itticloke Satellite Croat 591 Main Stns.,* lidelak.c No Hid S S 0.0% 

441 Taboo City ( .0(11111011Se 25111 North 1.4e Blvd. Tahoe City No Bid S 5 

442 Join-non Bldg. 1354 Johnson Blvd. Smith like Tahoe No Bid S S 00.115:`• 

443 Juserth Center 10075 Emote Ave Truckee IX S S 0.0% 

4.44 Santa Marta Coons Bldg, C • 1) 312 E. Cook St. Santa Maria 

Bliidid 

No 5 S 	- 0.07. 

445 Sunnysole Superior Court 605 W El Camino Real Sonny, ale s S 	290.00 S 	29145 0.5% 

446 Morgan I lill Superior  Coon 301 Diana Ave Morgan hill x S 	170.35 S 	171.20 03% 

447 Coon Pmbation Agency 669 County Square, Dr 0101 Ventura x S 	17137 S 	172.23 O.M. 

448 Jucenik Courthouse 4353 Vineyattl Ate Oxnard x S 	191E00 5 	291.45 0.5% 

440 Probation Agency 1721 Pacific Ave Ste 140 Oxnard it S 	2911.011 S 	291.45 0.5% 

494 Poshettion Agency 1911 William, Dr, 0175 Oynatd x S 	171.17 5 	172.23 0.5% 

451 41 \11/101 DM \ '3 ',tort VVintloy, 4050 S. Soviet's Rd t Hood S 	29111111 S 	291.45 0.5% 

1.1. Contractor's pricing assumes checks are covered for reconstruction purposes. 
1.2. Pickup and delivery times are subject to mutual agreement. 
1.3. Same day delivery is contingent upon use of central cash vault at mutually agreed upon location. 
1.4. The deposit contents of each pickup will not exceed $100,000. 
1.5. No more than 3 items presented for pickup at each location. 
1.6. Item limits for consolidated locations can be negotiated. 
1.7. Premise time will not exceed 6 minutes. Time beyond 6 minutes will be changed at $2.00 per additional minute. 

Contractor shall work with the purchasing group members to minimize excess premise fees. 
1.8. Purchasing Group Members will not require that weapons are surrendered before entering the building. 
1.9. Pricing assumes award of a substantial number of locations. 
1.10. Monthly rate includes pickup schedule to include Monday through Friday, unless otherwise noted and excluding holidays. 
1.11. Pricing assumes delivery to the bank's central cash vault. 

2. Security dual compartment deposit bags are available for purchase from Dunbar BankPak at (800) 766-9145. Pricing is as 
follows: 

2.1. SKU — 917BPTB 
Dual Compartment Bank Deposit Bag, clear film, 400 per box 

9" x 17" 
Price - $55.00! per 400 

2.2. SKU 1017BPTB 
10" x 17" Dual Compartment Bank Deposit Bag, clear film, 400 per box 
Price - $600.00/ per 400 

3. All pricing in the schedule above shall remain fixed for at least the one (1) year term of this Master Agreement, as set forth in 
paragraph 2 (Term) of Exhibit C Master Agreement General Conditions. If the Judicial Council elects to extend the term of this 
Master Agreement, the Judicial Council will use the proposed price adjustment factors applicable during the option period(s) 
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and the price adjustments will be set forth in a written amendment to this Master Agreement. Any agreed-upon price 
adjustment may not exceed during any one (1) year option period the Consumer Price Index as published by the U.S. Bureau of 
Labor Statistics. 

4. Payment will be provided to Contractor by the Purchasing Group member as set forth in paragraph 11 (Invoices and Payment) 
of Exhibit C Master Agreement General Conditions. 

5. Purchasing Group members are exempt from federal excise taxes and no payment will be made for any taxes levied on 
Contractor's or any subcontractor employee's wages. Purchasing Group members will pay for any applicable State of 
California or local sales or use taxes on the products provided or the services rendered. All tax must be included as a separate 
line item on Contractor's invoice. 

6. Contractor shall not charge nor shall the Purchasing Group members pay any overtime rate. 

7. Contractor shall not request nor shall the Purchasing Group members consider any reimbursement for non-production work 
including but not limited to time spent traveling to and from the job site or any living expenses. 

R. The fees paid by the Judicial Branch to the Contractor shall be at least as low as those fees charged by the Contractor to its 
other customers in local and state government that are receiving substantially comparable services at substantially comparable 
volumes over a similar period of time to the Services provided to the Judicial Branch Group ("Government Contract"). The 
foregoing comparison shall take into effect total scope, volume, geography to the extent that geography has a direct effect on 
the Contractor's actual costs), services levels (when taken as a whole), technology, and assets associated with the services 
provided by the Contractor in each case and any taxes and transition charges included within the charges for such services. If, 
during the Tenn, the Contractor enters into a Government Contract contradicting the foregoing sentence, the Contractor shall 
(a) give the Judicial Branch immediate notice of any such lower pricing, and (b) offer to the Judicial Branch an immediate 
adjustment to the terms of this Agreement to reflect such lower pricing. At least once each year during the Term, upon the 
Judicial Branch's request and officer of the Contractor shall certify to the Judicial Branch that this obligation has not been 
contradicted by any transaction entered into by the Contractor since the later of the (1) Effective Date and (2) date of the most 
recent certification provided by the Contractor pursuant to this obligation. 

9. In the event of a lost or destroyed deposit, Contractor will assume the liability to pay for (a) all costs in effecting the 
identification and replacement of the checks and (b) the face value of the checks not reconstructed, except those checks which 
would not be collected at the time of loss, but not to exceed the aggregate amount of $5,000 per shipment for unreconstructed 
checks. Contractor's maximum liability for checks will not exceed the limit of $25,000 per shipment, which includes $5,000 
for checks that cannot be reconstructed. In the instance that cash is lost, the limits shall be $50,000 to $100.000. 

END OF EXHIBIT B 
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Company Name (Printed) 

Dunbar Armored, Inc. 

Federal ID 

Number 52-0675776 

Printed ame and Title  s  Person Signing J. Patrick Frampton, VP Bid Admin. 

  

Executed in the County of Baltimore in the State of MD Date Executed 6/15/2015 

 	7  By (Aut izg   attire 

Dunbar Armored, Inc. 
Agreement No. MA 301110 I Amendment No. 003 

DARFUR CONTRACTING ACT CERTIFICATION 

Pursuant to Public Contract Code (PCC) section 10478, if a proposer currently or within the 
previous three years has had business activities or other operations outside of the United States, it 
must either (i) certify that it is not a "scrutinized company" as defmed in PCC 10476, or (ii) 
receive written permission from the Judicial Council to submit a proposal. 

To submit a proposal to the Judicial Council, you must complete ONLY ONE of the following 
three paragraphs. To complete paragraph 1 or 2, simply check the corresponding box. To 
complete paragraph 3, check the corresponding box and complete the certification for paragraph 

3. 

X 	1. 	We do not currently have, and we have not had within the previous three years, 
business activities or other operations outside of the United States. 

OR 

1:1 	2. 	We are a "scrutinized company" as defined in PCC 10476, but we have received 
written permission from the Judicial Council to submit a proposal pursuant to 
PCC 10477(b). A copy of the written permission from the Judicial Council is 
included with our proposal. 

OR 

El 	3. 	We currently have, or we have had within the previous three years, business 
activities or other operations outside of the United States, but we certify below 
that we are not a "scrutinized company" as defmed in PCC 10476. 

CERTIFICATION FOR PARAGRAPH 3:  

I, the official named below, CERTIFY UNDER PENALTY OF PERJURY, that I am duly 
authorized to legally bind the proposer to the clause in paragraph 3. This certification is made 
under the laws of the State of California. 
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